HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102183607
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	09/30/2020
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	14

UNTINOI LOUIC	ONAL SERVICES RE					
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPT	ΓΙΟΝ			HOURS
08/05/2020	P M TIAO	Revise	Revise report		2.20	
08/14/2020	P M TIAO	Call with revise re	n Mr. Foster regardin	ig changes	to report and	0.30
		TOTAL	HOURS			2.50
TIMEKEEPER S	UMMARY:					
Timekeeper P m tiao		STATUS		HOURS	RATE	VALUE 1,562.50
FINITIAU		Partner		2.50	625.00	1,502.50
		TOTAL FEES	(\$)	2.50	625.00	1,562.50
	VANCED AND EXPE	TOTAL FEES	DESCRIPTION			1,562.50 Amount
	VANCED AND EXPE	TOTAL FEES		port Vendo		1,562.50
OR COSTS AD		TOTAL FEES	DESCRIPTION Litigation Supp	port Vendo		1,562.50 AMOUNT 1,287.78
	IARY:	TOTAL FEES	DESCRIPTION Litigation Supp	port Vendo		1,562.50 AMOUNT 1,287.78
OR COSTS AD MATTER SUMM Current	IARY:	TOTAL FEES	DESCRIPTION Litigation Supp	port Vendo		1,562.50 AMOUNT 1,287.78 1,287.78

HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102191379
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	02/11/2021
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	8

FOR PROFESSIO	ONAL SERVICES REN	DERED THROUGH DECEMBER 31,	2020:		
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION			HOURS
12/04/2020	P M TIAO	Review			0.50
40/40/0000					0.50
12/19/2020	S E HAYNIE	Calls and correspon Podolny, and Mr. Ra Mr. Hurd's first FOIA response; review do group	aphael re; documer A request; draft tem	nt review for plate for	6.50
12/30/2020	P M TIAO	Review and revise r review and respond		endations;	1.70
		TOTAL HOURS			8.70
TIMEKEEPER S	BUMMARY:				
TIMEKEEPER		STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
	_	Partner	2.20	695.00	1,529.00
S E HAYNIE	2	Project Attorney TOTAL FEES (\$)	6.50	395.00	2,567.50 4,096.50
MATTER SUMM	MARY:				
Current	t Fees: t Charges:				\$ 4,096.50 0.00
CURRE	CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE: \$4,096.50				

HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102192078
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	02/22/2021
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	10

FOR PROFESSIO	ONAL SERVICES REND	ERED THROUGH JANUARY	31, 2021:		
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	DESCRIPTION		
01/04/2021	J W SOLOWEY		Review and revise distance learning investigative report and recommendations.		
01/05/2021	J W SOLOWEY	Review and rev report and reco	vise distance learning i ommendations.	investigative	0.20
01/05/2021	P M TIAO	Revise distanc Foster	e learning report an	d send to Mr.	0.80
		TOTAL HOUR	S		5.20
TIMEKEEPER SI	ummary:				
TIMEKEEPER P M TIAO J W SOLOW				VALUE 556.00 1,738.00 2,294.00	
MATTER SUMM	ARY:				
Current Fees: \$2,294.00 Current Charges: 0.00					
CURRE	NT MATTER AM	OUNT DUE:			\$ 2,294.00

HUNTON ANDRE	WS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102181791
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	08/31/2020
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	13

jeviet e totro Abrola (

a waa shari waxa ku waxa ku ku

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JULY 31, 2020.

	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
07/01/2020	SREWARI	Call with P. Tiao	1.50
07/01/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise report; review and analyze sources to prepare references.	1.00
07/01/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Calls with Sona Rewari	2.90
07/01/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise draft report (.7); review Blackboard witness documents to prepare for BB interviews (4.9).	5.60
07/02/2020	T S COX	Discuss with P. Tiao	0.20
07/02/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Participate in call with School Board Chair and Vice- Chair	1.30
07/02/2020	S REWARI	Call with Chair, Vice Chair, J. Foster, P. Tiao, and S. Raphael re status of investigation and report.	1.20
07/02/2020	P M TIAO	Emails with Mr. Foster and FCSB regarding meeting; emails with Hunton team regarding privilege issues; call with FTI regarding response to Blackboard; prepare email response to Blackboard counsel requesting interview of Tim Tomlinson and renewing request for responsive documents, with proposed NDA	8.20
07/02/2020	L X XIA	Review Blackboard witness documents in preparation for witness interviews.	1.60
07/03/2020	T S COX	Research	0.40
07/03/2020	P M TIAO	Email to Blackboard counsel; call with Mr. Foster regarding next steps	0.50
07/05/2020	TSCOX	Research	4.30
07/06/2020	TSCOX	Research case law	4.50
07/06/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Review and edit file memo re contract claims	0.20
07/06/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and analyze upgrade correspondence.	0.50

CLIENT NAM	,	bol Board INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	102181791 08/31/2020 14
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
07/06/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Prepare for and Interview Trivir CEO Glen Knutti; identify documents to used in Tomlinson interview; emails with Blackboard and Trivir regarding interviews; calls and emails with FTI regarding interview; review	7.50
07/07/2020	T S COX	Call with P. Tiao et al.	1.00
07/07/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Call with team	0.50
07/07/2020	S REWARI	Call with T. Cox, P. Tiao, and S. Raphael call from K. Corbett-Sanders re status of investigation; call with P. Tiao re briefing of Chair; call with K. Corbett- Sanders re same.	1.00
07/07/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Interview Trivir CEO and engineers	5.30
07/08/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Prepare for and lead interview of Blackboard witness Tim Tomlinson; edit report based on Blackboard interviews	4.10
07/09/2020	T S COX	Reviewe- mail to S. Rewari re same	0.30
07/09/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Participate in call with Board chair; review	1.20
07/09/2020	S REWARI	Attend videoconference with Chair, Vice Chair, P. Tiao, J. Foster, and S. Raphael re status of investigation.	0.80
07/09/2020	P M TIAO	Call with Dr. Brabrand regarding feedback on the report; meeting with Chair and Vice-chair regarding report and summary; prepare for calls with Dr. Brabrand and Chair	2.80
07/10/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare for and interview Dean Ho and Sher Nasir;	5.50
07/12/2020	P M TIAO	Analyze Blackboard information and revise report	2.20
07/13/2020	Ρ Μ ΤΙΑΟ	Edit report; emails and calls with FTI regarding content for report and technical analysis	1.20
07/14/2020	P M TIAO	Revise report to reflect input from Blackboard	1.00
07/15/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Synthesize information responsive to Blackboard contentions; revise report; call with Mr. Foster	4.50
07/17/2020	K E GAUNT	Review documents in Relativity related to SLA negotiations; export documents and send to S. Haynie with explanation of results.	1.00

	IDREWS KURTH LLP		INVOICE:	102181791
CLIENT NAM		ol Board	DATE:	08/31/2020
FILE NUMBE	ER: 037077.MULTI		PAGE:	15
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION		HOURS
07/17/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with S. Haynie re BB contra conference with Board chair re investiga		1.30
07/17/2020	S REWARI	Call with P. Tiao, J. Foster, S. Raphael, and S. Pekarsky re status of review.	R. Andersor	n, 0.70
07/17/2020	ΡΜΊΑΟ	Prepare for and lead call with FCSB Cha Chair, Mr. Foster, and Hunton colleague		6.70
07/18/2020	P M TIAO	Revise		5.80
07/20/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Review material from S. Haynie; email v	vith team	0.30
07/20/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise report references.		2.70
07/20/2020	P M TIAO	Revise report and send to FTI and Hunt colleagues for feedback	on	10.60
07/21/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Review and edit report; emails with tear with S. Haynie; conference with P. Tiao; comment on Blackboard findings		e 3.50
07/21/2020	S REWARI	Review and edit/comment on draft repo	rt.	2.00
07/21/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise references; review a reference documents; review and revise		12.40
07/21/2020	P M TIAO	Revise report; emails and call with FTI r changes to report; emails with Hunton to regarding changes to report, preparation notes	eam	10.90
07/21/2020	L X XIA	Revise and finalize investigative report.		1.20
07/22/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with S. Haynie; call with clie Haynie; review and edit email to Blackb		0.70
07/22/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and organize report reference d	ocuments.	0.80
07/22/2020	P M TIAO	Emails with Hunton team and FTI regard to report; revise and finalize report; ema Foster regarding report		s 6.20
07/22/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise investigation report.		0.80
07/23/2020	P M TIAO	Revise report and send clean and redlin Foster	ie copy to M	r. 1.90
07/24/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Emails with S. Haynie		0.20
07/24/2020	S REWARI	Emails re draft report; call with S. Raph call with P. Tiao emails re same.	ael re same;	0.30

en Alteriterà (

HUNTON ANI CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	E: Fairfa	JRTH LLP ax County Scho 77.MULTI	ol Board DATE: PAGE:	102181791 08/31/2020 16
DATE	TIMEKEEPI	ER	DESCRIPTION	HOUF
07/24/2020	P M TIAC		Call with Mr. Foster regarding feedback on the report; call with Hunton colleagues regarding investigative issue; prepare draft memory finalize report per Mr. Foster's guidance and send to Chair and Vice-Chair	3.8
07/25/2020	P M TIAC	D	Prepare memo to FCSB send report to Hunton colleagues for review; call and emails with Mr. Foste regarding interviewing Laura Willey; email to Laura Willey requesting interview	7.4 r
07/27/2020	тѕсох		Review and suggest edits to memo to Board	1.5
07/27/2020	S REWA	RI	Review draft memo to Board call with S. Raphael and T. Cox re same; review T. Cox's edits to memo; make additional edits to memo; review edits from S. Raphael and J. Foster to draft memo;	0.7
07/27/2020	P M TIAC	D	Review edits to memory revise and finalize memo, send to chair and vice-chair; call with Stuart Raphael regarding memo; analyze TAC recommendations to board chair; analyze Blackboard arguments regarding SLA credit negotiations; prepare interview questions for Laura Willey	1 5.0
07/27/2020	L X XIA		Prepare presentation deck for July 29 School Board closed session.	2.8
07/28/2020	S A RAP	HAEL	Conference with G. Carlson and S. Haynie re BB contract dispute; participate in preparation session with J. Foster et al.	1.0
07/28/2020	S REWA	RI	Call with J. Foster, S. Raphael, and P. Tiao re prep for closed session; review draft PowerPoint for closed session; call with P. Tiao re revisions and edits to draft PowerPoint.	2.5
07/28/2020	P M TIA	C	Calls with Mr. Foster and Hunton team to prepare for FCSB closed session; revise powerpoint presentation for FCSB session; review report and notes in preparation for FCSB meeting	r 6.4
07/28/2020	L X XIA		Revise presentation materials for July 29 closed session School Board meeting.	2.2
07/29/2020	S A RAP	HAEL	Prepare for and participate in Board closed meeting	4.(
07/29/2020	\$ REWA	RI	Review revised PowerPoint for closed session; attend closed session.	4.0

yddael Carley Malerer V

si Adalah ka

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	,	ool Board DATE: PAGE;	E: 102181791 08/31/2020 17
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
07/29/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare for and lead presentation to FCSB	5.70
		calls with FTI regarding presentation and likely questions	er;
07/30/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Participate in call with J. Foster et al.	0.40
07/30/2020	S REWARI	Call with P. Tiao re follow-up to closed session; with J. Foster, S. Raphael, and P. Tiao re closed session debrief.	
07/30/2020	P M TIAO	Calls with Mr. Foster and Hunton	1.00
		TOTAL HOURS	192.00

area.

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
S A RAPHAEL	Partner	14.60	695.00	10,147.00
S REWARI	Partner	15.50	625.00	9,687.50
P M TIAO	Partner	117.10	625.00	73,187.50
T S COX	Counsel	12.20	495.00	6,039.00
K E GAUNT	Associate	1.00	395.00	395.00
L X XIA	Associate	14.20	395.00	5,609.00
J W SOLOWEY	Law Clerk	17.40	395.00	6,873.00
	TOTAL FEES (\$)			111,938.00

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

CODE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E118	Litigation Support Vendors	1,692.66
TOTAL CL	JRRENT EXPENSES (\$)	1,692.66

MATTER SUMMARY

Current Fees:	\$ 111,938.00
Current Charges:	1,692.66
CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:	\$ 113,630.66

HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102180154
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	08/07/2020
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	12

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020:

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
06/01/2020	R M BATES	Review and respond to multiple correspondence from P. Tiao regarding investigation	0.80
06/01/2020	P M TIAO	Discuss scope of work with FTI and Hunton colleagues; analyze ; develop budget for remaining work on this investigation; revise scope of work and re-circulate it to FTI and Hunton	10.40
06/01/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise	0.30
06/02/2020	R M BATES	Review various correspondence regarding investigation; review various draft of investigation outline; telephone call with team regarding same	1.50
06/02/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with P. Tiao conference with J. Foster	1.70
06/02/2020	S REWARI	Review ; call with P. Tiao, S. Raphael, and R. Bates re same; call with J. Foster, P. Tiao, S. Raphael, and R. Bates re same.	2.00
06/02/2020	P M TIAO	Revise and discuss with FTI and Hunton colleagues; call with Mr. Foster	6.60
06/03/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Call with Stuart Raphael ; call with Blackboard counsel Jeff Chiow	2.00
06/04/2020	R M BATES	Review	0.30
06/04/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Prepare for call with J. Chiow; conference with J. Chiow and P. Tiao	0.70
06/04/2020	P M TIAO	Revise ; call with Blackboard counsel Jeff Chiow	2.70
06/05/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conferences with P. Tiao	0.50
06/05/2020	P M TIAO	, document requests with Hunton colleagues, FTI; finalize budget estimates send to Mr. Foster; revise document requests	5.30
06/06/2020	P M TIAO	Review document requests and email to Hunton team regarding the same	2.80

FILE NUMBE		ol Board DATE: PAGE:		102180154 08/07/2020 13
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION		HOURS
06/08/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Review and edit document requests to Blackbo	ard	0.20
06/08/2020	P M TIAO			1.00
06/09/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with P. Tiao		0.20
06/09/2020	P M TIAO	Call with Mr. Foster		0.60
06/10/2020	K E GAUNT	Telephone call with P. Tiao; provide link to Blackboard for upload of documents.		0.10
06/10/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Prepare response to Blackboard questions regard document request and witness interviews; ema with Blackboard counsel and Hunton team regard document request and witness interviews	ils	3.10
06/11/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Revise Scope of work and send to Mr. Foster; of with FTI to prepare for witness interviews; calls Sona Rewari regarding question from Chair; pro- for and participate in interview of Frances Ivey; emails regarding call with Chair and Vice-Chair	with epare	4.60
06/12/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with J. Foster; conference with Boa Chair and J. Foster	ard	1.70
06/12/2020	S REWARI	Call with K. Corbett-Sanders, T. Dernak-Kaufax Tiao, S. Raphael, and J. Foster	κ, Ρ.	1.30
06/12/2020	P M TIAO	Preparation call with Mr. Foster regarding call w Board Chair and Vice-Chair; call with Hunton te ; call wit Board Chair and Vice-Chair, Mr. Foster, and Hu team ; interview Marty Smith	eam th	6.60
06/13/2020	S REWARI	Call with K. Corbett-Sanders re closed session; with K. Corbett-Sanders and P. Tiao re closed session and presentation to Board.	; call	0.50
06/13/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Call with board chair and Hunton colleagues; re SOW and send to Mr. Foster; refine outline for		4.50
06/15/2020	K E GAUNT	Attention to emails with L. Xia regarding summa of document review in chronology.	aries	0.20
06/15/2020	J W SOLOWEY		15	6.60
06/15/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	emails with Hunton and FTI teams regarding the same		9.40
06/15/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise		5.20
06/16/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review		6.00
06/16/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare for and Interview Scott Brabrand		3.30

CLIENT NAM		chool Board DATE: PAGE:	102180154 08/07/2020 14
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
06/16/2020	L X XIA	Review .	8.30
06/17/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review	3.00
06/17/2020	P M TIAO	Calls with FTI regarding report; ; revise report	3.20
06/17/2020	L X XIA	Review	5.60
06/18/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with J. Foster, P. Tiao and S. Rewari	0.50
06/18/2020	S REWARI	Call with S. Raphael, J. Foster, and P. Tiao re upcoming closed session and presentation to Board.	0.50
06/18/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review sources and chronology to prepare exhibits and references; prepare summaries for report; review and revise report.	7.10
06/18/2020	P M TIAO	Calls and emails with Hunton team and FTI regarding report; revise and draft sections of report; call with Mr. Foster regarding report format and presentation	13.20
06/18/2020	L X XIA	Review	9.80
06/19/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Review and edit investigative report; multiple calls with P. Tiao and S. Rewari	2.50
06/19/2020	S REWARI	Review and edit draft investigative report; attend closed session re draft report.	5.90
06/19/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise references and summaries for report.	2.50
06/19/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Revise, draft and finalize report and send to board; revise and finalize powerpoint for board; meet with board	15.00
06/19/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise draft investigative report.	4.70
06/20/2020	K E GAUNT	Attention to emails with P. Tiao email to P. Tiao and L. Xia regarding searches.	1.50
06/21/2020	K E GAUNT		0.40
06/21/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare for interviews of Blackboard witnesses	0.80
06/21/2020	L X XIA	Review and prepare summary of S. Persky and A. Dolan emails in preparation for interviews.	5.90

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		ool Board DA	VOICE: ATE: AGE:	102180154 08/07/2020 15
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION		HOURS
06/22/2020	K E GAUNT	P. Tiao and L. Xia regarding searches; ema regarding prior Blackboard productions of documents.	; email il P. Tiao	1.70
06/22/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Analyze response from Blackboard and call Blackboard counsel; call with Hunton team Foster regarding strategy for interviewing B staff; calls with FTI and Hunton team regard interview preparation and document review	and Mr. lackboard ding	7.80
06/22/2020	L X XIA	Review Blackboard documents in preparation witness interviews.	on for	2.70
06/23/2020	K E GAUNT	Telephone call with L. Xia regarding docum searches in Relativity.	ent	0.50
06/23/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise report; review and analy sources to prepare references.	ze	4.80
06/23/2020	P M TIAO	Interview Alison Calderon and Paul Downey preparation for Blackboard interviews; analy Blackboard documents and emails with Hur regarding Blackboard interviews	yze	6.80
06/23/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise Blackboard witness docu preparation of witness interviews.	uments in	6.10
06/24/2020	K E GAUNT	Search for key emails in Relativity for P. Tia documents to P. Tiao.	ao; email	0.40
06/24/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise report; review and analy sources to prepare references.	ze	0.80
06/24/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare for and participate in interview of A Dolan; prepare for interview of Scott Persky		6.70
06/24/2020	L X XIA	Review BB witness documents in preparation witness interviews.	on for BB	4.60
06/25/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise report; review and analy sources to prepare references.	ze	6.00
06/25/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare for and interview Scott Persky; revi documents in preparation for Brunda Arepa interview; negotiations with Blackboard cou regarding witness availability	lli	5.00
06/25/2020	L X XIA	Review documents of Blackboard witnesses prepare material for witness interviews; revi revise draft report.		9.70
06/26/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise report; review and analy, sources to prepare references.	ze	5.30

HUNTON AND CLIENT NAMI FILE NUMBEI	E: Fairfax Count	y School Board		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	102180154 08/07/2020 16
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION			HOUR
06/26/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Blackboard counse prepare for and lea	ooard interviews; neg el about witness ava ad Interview of Brung er and Hunton and F ion strategy	ilability; da Arepalli;	4.50
06/26/2020	L X XIA		s of Blackboard witn or witness interviews gative report.		6.80
06/27/2020	P M TIAO	Blackboard witnes	3 hearings in prepar s interviews; analyzo on's roles in preparat	e summary of	4.3
06/29/2020	P M TIAO	Prepare interview	outline for Blackboa	rd witnesses	2.50
06/29/2020	L X XIA		Review Blackboard witness documents and prepare for additional Blackboard witness interviews.		3.20
06/30/2020	J W SOLOWEY		Review and revise report; review and analyze sources to prepare references.		0.50
06/30/2020	P M TIAO	Mr. Foster regardin regarding email fro	Analyze email from Blackboard counsel and email to Mr. Foster regarding the same; call with Mr. Foster regarding email from Blackboard counsel and issues relating to Trivir; analyze information relating to technical response		
06/30/2020	L X XIA	Review and revise	draft investigative r	eport.	2.10
		TOTAL HOURS			277.7
TIMEKEEPER S	UMMARY:				
TIMEKEEPER		STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALU
R M BATES		Partner	2.60	625.00	1,625.00
S A RAPHAE	ΞL	Partner	8.00	695.00	5,560.0
S REWARI		Partner	10.20	625.00	6,375.0
P M TIAO		Partner	134.50	625.00	84,062.5
K E GAUNT		Associate	4.80	395.00	1,896.0
L X XIA		Associate	75.00	395.00	29,625.0
J W SOLOW	/EY	Law Clerk	42.60	395.00	16,827.0
		TOTAL FEES (\$)			145,970.5

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

CODE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E118	Litigation Support Vendors	2,390.16
TOTAL CU	JRRENT EXPENSES (\$)	2,390.16

HUNTON ANDRE	WS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102180154
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	08/07/2020
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	17

MATTER SUMMARY:

Current Fees:	\$ 145,970.50
Current Charges:	2,390.16
CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:	\$ 148,360.66

HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102201788
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	08/20/2021
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	14

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	RENDERED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021:			
DATE TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION			HOURS
06/21/2021 T S COX	Research	; su	immarize	5.30
06/21/2021 S E HAYNIE	Research communications re: to inquiry from J. Fo	same; draft propos		1.90
06/21/2021 P M TIAO	Analyze			0.50
06/22/2021 P M TIAO	Analyze regarding the same		h Mr. Foster	0.50
06/23/2021 P M TIAO	Review Blackboard	report and send to	Mr. Foster	0.40
	TOTAL HOURS		an an an ann	8.60
TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:				
TIMEKEEPER P M TIAO T S COX S E HAYNIE	STATUS Partner Counsel Senior Associate	HOURS 1.40 5.30 1.90	RATE 750.00 595.00 495.00	VALUE 1,050.00 3,153.50 940.50
MATTER SUMMARY:	TOTAL FEES (\$)			5,144.00
Current Fees:				\$ 5,144.00
Current Charges:				0.00

CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:

\$ 5,144.00

HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102189320
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	12/31/2020
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	8

FOR PROFESSION	NAL SERVICES RE	NDERED THROUGH NOVEMBER 3	30, 2020:		
DATE T	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION			HOURS
11/01/2020 F	P M TIAO	Emails regarding	FOIA issue		0.50
		TOTAL HOURS			0.50
TIMEKEEPER SU	MMARY:				
TIMEKEEPER		STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
P M TIAO		Partner	0.50	695.00	347.50
		TOTAL FEES (\$)		·	347.50
MATTER SUMMA	RY:				
Current F	Fees:				\$ 347.50
Current (Charges:				0.00
CURREN	NT MATTER A	MOUNT DUE:			\$ 347.50

HUNTON ANDRE	EWS KURTH LLP	INVOICE:	102187435
CLIENT NAME:	Fairfax County School Board	DATE:	11/30/2020
FILE NUMBER:	037077.MULTI	PAGE:	8

FOR PROFESSIO	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED T	HROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2020:	
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/01/2020	S REWARI	Review draft summary and provide feedback to J. Foster.	0.20
10/16/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Call with Mr. Foster and FTI regarding statement to media regarding cost of distance learning report	1.00
10/18/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Revise statement to reporter and TPs for Board and emails with Mr. Foster and FTI regarding the same; call with Mr. Foster	2.00
10/22/2020	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster and P. Tiao re distance learning summary; call with J. Foster, P. Tiao, and R. Sizemore-Hizer re same.	1.50
10/22/2020	P M TIAO	Call and emails with Mr. Foster regarding board statement on the report	1.20
10/24/2020	S REWARI	Call with P. Tiao re distance learning review summary.	0.20
10/24/2020	P M TIAO	Review tech advisory report and distance learning report; revise board statement	3.00
10/26/2020	T S COX	Research privilege issues at request of P. Tiao	2.30
10/26/2020	S REWARI	Calls with P. Tiao re distance learning statement; review and edit draft sections of statement; emails re same; calls with P. Tiao re same.	1.30
10/26/2020	ΡΜΤΙΑΟ	Revise statement of the board and emails and calls regarding the same; review April 16 open meeting regarding a source for board statement	8.90
10/27/2020	T S COX	Research	1.30
10/27/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Review and comment on FCSB statement	0.10
10/27/2020	S REWARI	Review updated draft summary; review comments from S. Raphael and T. Cox re same; review emails re same; review Ms. Sizemore's comments and edits.	0.50
10/27/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and revise investigative report.	1.30
10/27/2020	P M TIAO	Emails with Hunton team regarding revisions to the board statement; calls with Mr. Foster regarding revised board statement; update board statement; edit distance learning report, and emails with Hunton team regarding final changes; call with FTI analyze comments/edits from FTI and board	5.40

members; analyze Tech Advisory Council Report

CLIENT NAMI		y School Board		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	102187435 11/30/2020 9
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION			HOURS
0/28/2020	S REWARI		Foster, P. Tiao, R. Sizemor learning statement.	e-Hizer et al.	1.00
10/28/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and	revise Investigative Repor	t.	1.00
10/28/2020			Calls with Mr. Foster and FTI regarding board statement; call with Mr. Foster and Mr. Sethi regarding revisions to board statement		3.30
10/29/2020	J W SOLOWEY	Review and	revise Investigative Report	t.	5.70
10/29/2020	P M TIAO	calls with F⊺ regarding di	Revise draft statements of the board; emails and calls with FTI, Mr. Foster, Mr. Sethi and Mr. Smith regarding draft statement; participate in briefing of board on releasing the statement or the report		7.00
		TOTAL HO	URS		48.20
IMEKEEPER S	ummary:				
IMEKEEPER		STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
s a raphae	ΞL	Partner	0.10	695.00	69.50
S REWARI		Partner	4.70	625.00	2,937.50
P M TIAO		Partner	31.80	695.00	22,101.00
r s cox		Counsel	3.60	495.00	1,782.00
J W SOLOW	'EY	Associate TOTAL FEES (\$)	8.00	395.00	3,160.00 30,050.00
	ANCED AND EXPENS			_	00,000100
		2025	DECODIDITION		AMOUNT
		((()))			AMOONT
		CODE F118	DESCRIPTION	ors	1 175 22
		E118	Litigation Support Vendo	ors	1,175.22 1,175.22
	ARY:	E118		ors	
MATTER SUMM		E118	Litigation Support Vendo	ors	1,175.22
MATTER SUMM Current	Fees:	E118	Litigation Support Vendo	ors	1,175.22 \$ 30,050.00
MATTER SUMM Current		E118	Litigation Support Vendo	prs	1,175.22