

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP  
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board  
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102192078  
DATE: 02/22/2021  
PAGE: 21

**RE: (Hunton # 037077.0000302) VARIOUS SCHOOL BD MEMBERS MATTERS**

**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2021:**

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
01/29/2021	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster and E. Tholen re recall petition; [REDACTED]	1.00
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>			<b>1.00</b>

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
S REWARI	Partner	1.00	625.00	625.00
<b>TOTAL FEES (\$)</b>				<b>625.00</b>

**MATTER SUMMARY:**

Current Fees:	\$ 625.00
Current Charges:	0.00
<b>CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:</b>	<b>\$ 625.00</b>

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP  
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board  
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102181791  
DATE: 08/31/2020  
PAGE: 19

**RE: (Hunton # 037077.0000302) VARIOUS SCHOOL BD MEMBERS MATTERS**

**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JULY 31, 2020:**

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
07/17/2020	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster [REDACTED] [REDACTED] call with J. Foster, R. Anderson and S. Pekarsky re same; call with R. Anderson and S. Pekarsky re questions relating to Superintendent's evaluation.	1.25
07/20/2020	S REWARI	Review Superintendent's contract, FCPS regulations, and State Board regulations and guidance re evaluations, to address questions from Chair and Vice Chair.	0.75
07/21/2020	S REWARI	[REDACTED] begin drafting memo re same.	1.50
07/22/2020	S REWARI	Research and draft memo to Board [REDACTED] [REDACTED] emails with J. Foster re draft memo; finalize and email memo to Chair and Vice Chair.	3.75
07/24/2020	S REWARI	Call with Chair [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50
07/28/2020	S REWARI	Call from J. Foster [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.25
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>			<b>8.00</b>

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
S REWARI	Partner	8.00	625.00	5,000.00
<b>TOTAL FEES (\$)</b>				<b>5,000.00</b>

**MATTER SUMMARY:**

Current Fees:	\$ 5,000.00
Current Charges:	0.00
<b>CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:</b>	<b>\$ 5,000.00</b>

**RE: (Hunton # 037077.0000302) VARIOUS SCHOOL BD MEMBERS MATTERS**

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020:

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
06/01/2020	D L GUNN	[REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	2.50
06/01/2020	S REWARI	Review email from J. Foster [REDACTED]; call with J. Foster re same.	0.25
06/02/2020	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster [REDACTED]	0.25
06/03/2020	S REWARI	Review [REDACTED]	0.25
06/05/2020	S REWARI	Call with K. Corbett-Sanders re LT contracts, closed session on Luftglass, and refile of [REDACTED] case.	1.00
06/11/2020	S REWARI	Call with K. Corbett-Sanders re Superintendent's evaluation and scheduling of outstanding matters before end of fiscal year.	0.25
06/12/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with J. Foster [REDACTED]	0.25
06/12/2020	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster and S. Raphael re meeting with Board member.	0.25
06/22/2020	S REWARI	Call with K. Corbett-Sanders and K. Keys-Gamarra re questions relating to Superintendent's contract and evaluation; call with Chair and Vice Chair re questions relating to same; attend closed session to address legal questions and advice regarding same.	2.00
06/24/2020	S A RAPHAEL	Conference with S. Rewari re various Board issues	0.25
06/26/2020	S REWARI	Call with K. Corbett-Sanders, T. Dernak-Kaufax, and I. Muhlberg re Superintendent's evaluation; review draft evaluation and guidelines document from Board of Education; emails re draft.	1.25
06/30/2020	S REWARI	Call from K. Corbett-Sanders and T. Dernak-Kaufax re technology advisory council; review draft memo prepared by K. Corbett-Sanders; edit draft memo; call with K. Corbett-Sanders re same; call with I. Muhlberg re emails and FOIA; review and edit revised draft memo from K. Corbett-Sanders; call with K. Corbett-Sanders re same.	1.75
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>			<b>10.25</b>

---

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP  
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board  
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

---

INVOICE: 102180154  
DATE: 08/07/2020  
PAGE: 20

---

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
S A RAPHAEL	Partner	0.50	695.00	347.50
S REWARI	Partner	7.25	625.00	4,531.25
D L GUNN	Librarian	2.50	200.00	500.00
<b>TOTAL FEES (\$)</b>				<b>5,378.75</b>

**MATTER SUMMARY:**

Current Fees:	\$ 5,378.75
Current Charges:	0.00
<b>CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:</b>	<b>\$ 5,378.75</b>

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP  
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board  
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102201788  
DATE: 08/20/2021  
PAGE: 24

**RE: (Hunton # 037077.0000302) VARIOUS SCHOOL BD MEMBERS MATTERS**

**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021:**

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
06/16/2021	S REWARI	Call with Chair Anderson regarding superintendent's contract and search.	0.25
06/24/2021	S REWARI	Attend closed session regarding superintendent search.	0.50
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>			<b>0.75</b>

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
S REWARI	Partner	0.75	750.00	562.50
<b>TOTAL FEES (\$)</b>				<b>562.50</b>

**MATTER SUMMARY:**

Current Fees:	\$ 562.50
Current Charges:	0.00
<b>CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:</b>	<b>\$ 562.50</b>

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP  
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board  
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102187435  
DATE: 11/30/2020  
PAGE: 23

**RE: (Hunton # 037077.0000302) VARIOUS SCHOOL BD MEMBERS MATTERS**

**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2020:**

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/01/2020	C C GIRAGOSIAN	Review and revise audit letter	0.25
10/25/2020	S REWARI	Review materials relating to Boyle grievance.	1.50
10/26/2020	S REWARI	Call with Chair Anderson re law governing renewal of Superintendent contracts; gather information for memo re same; begin drafting memo re same; review email re recall petition effort; call from Chair Anderson re same; draft email re advice on response to same; emails with J. Foster and S. Raphael re recall petitions; email to Board re same; calls re Boyle grievance; review [REDACTED]	3.25
10/27/2020	S REWARI	Edit draft memo re renewal of Superintendent contract; call from Chair Anderson re same; edit draft memo; transmit same to Chair Anderson; call from Chair Anderson re same.	0.50
10/29/2020	S REWARI	Attend closed session re Boyle grievance; emails and calls re motion after closed.	2.25
10/30/2020	S REWARI	Call with B. Madeja re communication to Boyle re grievance outcome; call with E. Kennedy re grievance outcome and remand; review and edit draft letter to Boyle and King; review and respond to email re constituent inquiries re HAK review;	1.25
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>			<b>9.00</b>

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
C C GIRAGOSIAN	Partner	0.25	695.00	173.75
S REWARI	Partner	8.75	625.00	5,468.75
<b>TOTAL FEES (\$)</b>				<b>5,642.50</b>

**MATTER SUMMARY:**

Current Fees:	\$ 5,642.50
Current Charges:	0.00
<b>CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:</b>	<b>\$ 5,642.50</b>