






























   

   

  

            
            

            
   

             
     

              

 

   

     
  
  

  
  

 

 

               
            

  

   

 













   

 

  

  

  

 

 



















































































   

   

   

  
  

  
  

 

 

  
              

    

    

 









   

   

   

  
  

 

  

 













   

   

  

   
              

              
 

            
 

       
      

    

   

  
  

 

   

 













   

   

  

   
           
    

         
             

               
     

    

              

        
             

        
       
        
         
         

           
         
          
          

     
        

       
    

          
        

           

     
            
    

           
     

        
             

   
         
       

          

         
          

        
       

  
 

   

 
 

 



   

   

      
             

       

        

   

   

  
  

  
 

 

              
              
            
            

  

  

 

 







   

   

  

   
       

              

   

   

  
 

   

 







   

   

  

     
 
 

              
          

    

   

  
  

 

   

 



































   

   

  

 
 

   
           

   

   

  
 

  

 



















   

    

 

  
                
              
              
              
              
            
            
            
            
            

    

    

 









   

   

 









   

   

   

  
  
  

 

 

  
            
            

  

   

 

























































   

   

 

    

 
             

 
            

 
            

 
          

  

 







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 433705 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Wade T. Anderson .70 300.00 210.00 
Bradford A. King 90.20 335.00 30,217.00 
Nicole S. Cheuk 106.70 300.00 32,010.00 

TOTALS 197.60  $ 62,437.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

7/01/20 BAK Witness preparation (5.20); review Response to Motion to Esclude (.20). 5.40 1,809.00 

7/01/20 NSC Witness prep (5.0); prepared witness statements (3.2), prepared witness list (.5) 8.70 2,610.00 

7/02/20 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer and witness  (.1); finalize 
witness list, exhibit binders and draft letter to hearing officer (.3); draft Reply to 
Response to Motion to Exclude (1.2) 

1.60 536.00 

7/02/20 NSC Prepared witness outline (1.2), reviewed and revised response to petitioner's 
response (.2) 

1.40 420.00 

7/02/20 WTA Review  .30 90.00 

7/03/20 BAK Review  
. 

.20 67.00 

7/05/20 BAK Prepare witness outlines. 1.40 469.00 

7/05/20 NSC Prepared witness outline .60 180.00 

7/06/20 BAK Witness preparation (1.0); e-mails from hearing officer re: Decision on Motion to 
Exclude (.1); draft letter  (.3); e-mail to Ms. 
Lucas re: attempt to deliver documents (.1); e-mail from Ms. Lucas  

 (.1); draft witness outlines (2.5); initial review of ' proposed 
witness list and exhibits (1.0); e-mail to hearing officer re: objections to same (.2). 

5.30 1,775.50 

7/06/20 BAK Call to Ms. Schaefer . .30 100.50 

7/06/20 NSC Witness prep meeting, communication regarding exhibits, continued prep of 
witness outlines, review of parent witness/exhibits 

6.20 1,860.00 

7/07/20 BAK Witness preparation (5.1); pre-hearing conference call (1.0); follow-up call with 
Ms. Schaefer (.3). 

6.40 2,144.00 

7/07/20 NSC Witness preparation and prepared witness outline (6.10); prehearing conference 
call (1.0) 

7.10 2,130.00 

7/08/20 BAK E-mails from Ms. Lucas  (.2); witness 
preparation. (5.9) 

6.10 2,043.50 

7/08/20 NSC Review and response  (.9), witness 
preparation (7.5) 

8.50 2,550.00 



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 433705 
 

3 
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

7/09/20 BAK Witness preparation (2.5); research  (.3); draft Motion to 
Exclude Documents (1.3); e-mail from Ms. Lucas re: audio files (.1); e-mail from 
hearing officer re: pre-hearing issues (.1). 

4.30 1,440.50 

7/09/20 NSC Continued witness preparation (2.9); review and revision to motion (1.1) 4.00 1,200.00 

7/10/20 BAK Review Petitioner's proposed exhibits (2.7); call to Attorney Foster re: status (.2). 
review response to motion to exclude and email to hearing officer re: same (.2); 
prepare cross examinations (1.0); call from Ms. Schaefer re: hearing issues (.2); 
review fifth pre-hearing order (.2). 

4.50 1,507.50 

7/10/20 NSC Prepared cross examination notes for two proposed witnesses (3.3); reviewed 
 

(.3) 

3.60 1,080.00 

7/11/20 BAK E-mails from Ms. Lucas and Hearing Officer (.2); call to Ms. Schaefer re: same (.2); 
draft list of documents to be excluded (1.0); draft cross examination (.5); prepare 
opening argument (.9). 

2.80 938.00 

7/11/20 NSC Reviewed various communications from parent advocate (.2); continued to 
prepare cross examination outlines (1.9); review and revision to motion regarding 
documents (.3) 

2.40 720.00 

7/13/20 BAK Prepare for and attend first day of hearing (5.1); research a  
 (4.9); calls and e-mails to/from Ms. Schaefer (.3). 

10.30 3,450.50 

7/13/20 WTA Assist with briefing issues motion to dismiss .40 120.00 

7/13/20 NSC Participated in due process hearing (5.1); prepared motion to dismiss and research 
in regard to same (4.4) 

9.50 2,850.00 

7/14/20 BAK Review Petitioners' Response to Motion to Dismiss (.2); calls to Ms. Schaefer (.5); 
review hearing officer's decision (.1);  attend second day of hearing (3.8); 

4.60 1,541.00 

7/14/20 NSC Participated in due process hearing, prepared witness examination outlines 7.80 2,340.00 

7/15/20 BAK Prepare for and attend day three of hearing (7.1); confer with administration re: 
documents issue (.3). 

7.40 2,479.00 

7/15/20 NSC Participated in due process hearing (7.1); prepared direct examination outline 
(4.5) 

11.60 3,480.00 

7/16/20 BAK Prepare for and attend day four of hearing. 9.00 3,015.00 

7/16/20 NSC Attended due process hearing 8.20 2,460.00 

7/17/20 BAK Prepare for and attend day five of hearing. 5.20 1,742.00 

7/17/20 NSC Participated in due process hearing 5.20 1,560.00 

7/20/20 BAK Review final letter to Hearing Officer -mail re: same (.2); e-
mail from advocate re same (.1). 

.30 100.50 

7/20/20 NSC Review of letter submitted to Hearing Officer, related emails .30 90.00 

7/21/20 BAK E-mails from administration . .20 67.00 

7/21/20 NSC Began preparing closing brief for due process hearing .70 210.00 
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Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 433705 
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Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

7/22/20 NSC Continued drafting closing brief 3.30 990.00 

7/23/20 BAK Research for closing brief. 1.30 435.50 

7/23/20 NSC Continued drafting closing brief,  5.50 1,650.00 

7/24/20 BAK Draft closing brief. 7.20 2,412.00 

7/24/20 NSC Continued review of transcript .70 210.00 

7/25/20 NSC Continued review of transcript .70 210.00 

7/26/20 BAK Review Petitioners' Closing Argument and attachments (1.0); continue 
drafting/revising Closing Brief (2.5). 

3.50 1,172.50 

7/26/20 NSC Continued preparing closing brief and reviewing transcript 1.00 300.00 

7/27/20 BAK Continue drafting/revise Closing Brief. 2.30 770.50 

7/27/20 NSC Review of petitioner's closing argument (1.0); , continued drafting and revising 
FCPS closing brief,  (6.8) 

7.80 2,340.00 

7/28/20 BAK Finalize Closing Brief (.5); call to Ms. Schaefer re: same (.1). .60 201.00 

7/28/20 NSC Finalized closing brief 1.70 510.00 

7/29/20 NSC Emails to R. Mitchell regarding hard copy of closing brief, drafted cover letter for 
same, arranged for delivery of same 

.20 60.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                    $ 62,437.00  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
7/03/20 Richmond Express, Inc., MESSENGER SERVICE, Period Ending 06/30/20, 

7/3/2020, Post OfficeDowntown 
 155.36 

7/06/20 COPIES 319.00 79.75 
7/06/20 COPIES 3028.00 757.00 
7/06/20 COLOR COPIES 6.00 6.00 
7/06/20 BINDERS 1.00 2.00 
7/06/20 BINDERS 6.00 12.00 
7/09/20 COPIES, 14 @ .25/Copy 14.00 3.50 
7/22/20 COPIES 461.00 115.25 
7/23/20 Richmond Express, Inc., MESSENGER SERVICE, Period Ending 7/15/2020, 

7/23/2020, Candace Lucas 
 23.02 

7/23/20 Richmond Express, Inc., MESSENGER SERVICE, Period Ending 7/15/2020, 
7/23/2020, Daniel Siegel 

 27.33 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                $ 1,181.21    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                $ 63,618.21                
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OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
 
Invoice Number Date Invoice 

   Total 
Payments 

   Received 
Ending 

   Balance 
429181 7/06/20 44,353.50 .00 44,353.50 
 
 
 Previous Balance       $ 44,353.50 
 
 Balance Due This Invoice        $ 63,618.21  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE       $ 107,971.71     
  



































 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 458157 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .70 335.00 234.50 
Nicole S. Cheuk 3.10 300.00 930.00 

TOTALS 3.80  $ 1,164.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

12/01/20 NSC Review/analysis  .50 150.00 

12/04/20 BAK Review/reply to e-mails from Ms. Schaefer . .10 33.50 

12/04/20 NSC Review and response to emails regarding FOIA request .40 120.00 

12/11/20 BAK Email from administration and call to Ms. Schaefer . .20 67.00 

12/18/20 BAK Email from and call to Attorney Falconi . .20 67.00 

12/18/20 NSC Review and response to emails from R. Falconi regarding courier receipt .30 90.00 

12/21/20 NSC Review and response to email from R. Falconi  .20 60.00 

12/23/20 NSC Reviewed and responded to emails  
 

1.50 450.00 

12/28/20 BAK Review/reply to e-mails from Attorney Falconi and Ms. Strong  
 

.20 67.00 

12/28/20 NSC Review and analysis  .20 60.00 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                     $ 1,164.50  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                 $ 1,164.50                
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Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 458157 
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OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
 
Invoice Number Date Invoice 

   Total 
Payments 

   Received 
Ending 

   Balance 
453445 12/08/20 1,172.50 .00 1,172.50 
 
 
 Previous Balance        $ 1,172.50 
 
 Balance Due This Invoice         $ 1,164.50  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE         $ 2,337.00     
  













 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       March 4, 2021 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 467807 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 1.20 335.00 402.00 

TOTALS 1.20  $ 402.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

2/08/21 BAK E-mail from/to Ms. Amos . .20 67.00 

2/09/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Amos and Ms. Schaefer  
. 

.20 67.00 

2/10/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Amos and Ms. Schaefer  
. 

.40 134.00 

2/19/21 BAK Review OCR letter of findings. .20 67.00 

3/01/21 BAK E-mails from Ms. Schaefer  .20 67.00 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 402.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 402.00                
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Client No. 022203                       April 9, 2021 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 472657 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .40 335.00 134.00 
Bradford A. King 1.70 350.00 595.00 
Nicole S. Cheuk .80 315.00 252.00 

TOTALS 2.90  $ 981.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/04/21 BAK Email from Ms. Schaefer  .20 67.00 

3/08/21 BAK E-mail from/to Ms. Gulbranson  
 

.20 67.00 

3/15/21 NSC Review and analysis , phone call with D. Schaefer and 
Attorney King in regard to same 

.50 157.50 

3/22/21 BAK Review ; e-mails re:  
 

.40 140.00 

3/23/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mails from Ms. Amos re:  
 

.20 70.00 

3/24/21 BAK E-mails from/to administrators . .20 70.00 

3/24/21 NSC Review  
 

.30 94.50 

3/25/21 BAK E-mail  brief 
review of same; review  

.70 245.00 

3/26/21 BAK Multiple e-mails from school administrators  
 

.20 70.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 981.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 981.00                
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Client No. 022203                       April 9, 2021 
Matter No. 105178                       Invoice No. 472658 
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SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Jason H. Ballum 2.00 315.00 630.00 
Bradford A. King 13.40 350.00 4,690.00 
Lloyd Lee Byrd 32.40 350.00 11,340.00 
Nicole S. Cheuk 25.30 315.00 7,969.50 
Kimberly A. Paulsrud 4.10 190.00 779.00 

TOTALS 77.20  $ 25,408.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/12/21 BAK Emails ; initial research  
call to Ms. Schaefer. 

1.80 630.00 

3/14/21 NSC Review of various emails from Attorney King and FCPS staff  
 

.20 63.00 

3/15/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer  call to Ms. Schaefer  
 call to Attorney Foster. 

.60 210.00 

3/15/21 LLB Analyzed  
 

 

2.40 840.00 

3/15/21 NSC Review  email to Attorney Byrd  
 

2.00 630.00 

3/16/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mail from Ms. Schaefer  
 review all documents,  

 filed with Court; e-mail to/from Attorney Foster's office  
 research and analyze  

2.50 875.00 

3/16/21 LLB Worked on litigation plan  
 

 

2.20 770.00 

3/16/21 NSC Phone call with Attorneys King and Byrd  
 

 

2.30 724.50 

3/17/21 BAK E-mails from team members  .40 140.00 

3/17/21 LLB Analyzed  
 

 

2.90 1,015.00 

3/17/21 NSC Continued review and analysis of complaint .30 94.50 

3/18/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer and administrators  
conference call with educators  

1.50 525.00 
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Matter No. 105178                       Invoice No. 472658 
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Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/18/21 LLB Worked on response tp First Amended Complaint; confirmed service of the 
Summons and Complaint was appropriate;  

1.20 420.00 

3/18/21 NSC Emails/phone call to D. Schaefer meeting with FCPS 
staff, participated in meeting with staff, continued review of complaint, 
preparation for responsive pleading, participated in meeting with Attorneys King 
and Byrd, began research  

5.10 1,606.50 

3/18/21 KAP Analyze  
 

.30 57.00 

3/19/21 BAK Confer with Attorney Cheuk  
review research  

.30 105.00 

3/19/21 LLB Updated Litigation Plan; analyzed  
 

 

3.90 1,365.00 

3/19/21 NSC Review  
 

3.00 945.00 

3/19/21 KAP Telephone conference with court clerk and judge's chambers regarding release of 
complaint and exhibits 

.40 76.00 

3/21/21 BAK Analyze arguments for response pleading. .40 140.00 

3/22/21 BAK Research ; calls and e-mails to 
Attorneys Kennedy and Foster  

1.20 420.00 

3/22/21 LLB Worked on litigation strategy and plan; telephone call  
 

 
 

5.30 1,855.00 

3/22/21 NSC Continued research  conference call with Attorneys 
Ballum, Byrd and King in regard to same and next steps 

4.50 1,417.50 

3/22/21 JHB Conference with Mr. King and Ms. Cheuk  
 analyze  

draft correspondences to Mr. King and Ms. Cheuk 

1.70 535.50 

3/23/21 BAK  
 

. 

1.20 420.00 

3/23/21 LLB Completed work on motion, brief, declaration; correspondence with client re: 
 telephone call with court re: sealed 

transcripts and exhibits 

3.70 1,295.00 

3/23/21 NSC Review of email communications  
 

1.40 441.00 

3/23/21 JHB Review multiple correspondences from Mr. Byrd; review multiple correspondences 
from Mr. King; draft correspondence to Mr. Byrd, Mr. King, and Ms. Cheuk 

; review correspondence from Mr. King 

.30 94.50 
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Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/23/21 KAP Prepare declaration exhibits; electronically file motion for extension, memorandum 
in support, attachments, and waiver of oral argument 

.90 171.00 

3/24/21 BAK E-mail to Ms. Schaefer  .10 35.00 

3/24/21 BAK Additional analysis  .70 245.00 

3/24/21 LLB Provided status update; supervised provision of required copies of pleadings to 
Chambers of Judge Trenga; legal research; telephone call with Case Manager re: 
seal exhibits; worked on litigation strategy 

3.70 1,295.00 

3/24/21 NSC Review of NOA, email from FCPS staff in regard to litigation, began drafting 
responsive pleading, meeting with Attorneys Byrd and King in regard to same 

1.10 346.50 

3/24/21 KAP Draft notices of appearance for B. King and N. Cheuk; email to client regarding 
courtesy copies of filed pleadings to judge 

.90 171.00 

3/25/21 BAK Review order granting motion for extension of time; e-mail to Ms. Schaefer and 
Attorneys Kennedy and Falconi re: same; strategize  

 

.90 315.00 

3/25/21 LLB Worked on outline for arguments  
 telephone call with law clerk re: status of motion to extend time; telephone 

call with case manager re: inventory of exhibits filed under seal; reviewed order 
granting extension of time to file respond to the First Amended Complaint 

3.90 1,365.00 

3/25/21 NSC Prepared , conference call with 
Attorneys Byrd and King in regard to same and next steps, review of order in regard 
to motion for extension of time 

4.20 1,323.00 

3/26/21 NSC Continued preparing  .80 252.00 

3/30/21 BAK Review/revise  
 e-mail to administration and in-house counsel re: same; review initial working 

draft  

1.40 490.00 

3/30/21 LLB Worked on motion and memorandum of law  
 

 

1.40 490.00 

3/30/21 NSC Review and revision to motion and memorandum in regard to exhibits, discussion 
with Attorney King  

.40 126.00 

3/31/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mails from Attorney Falconi and Ms. Schaefer re: draft Motion 
and supporting memorandum; confer with Attorney Byrd re: revision to same; 
review Order re: same; e-mail to clients re: same. 

.40 140.00 

3/31/21 LLB Worked on and filed motion and brief seeking access to plaintiffs' exhibits and 
transcripts; analyze  

 

1.80 630.00 

3/31/21 KAP Revise motion, memorandum and waiver; electronically file motion, memorandum 
and notice; draft correspondence to Judge Trenga; email pro se plaintiffs all 
pleadings filed 

1.60 304.00 
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  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                    $ 25,408.50  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
3/23/21 COPIES 80.00 20.00 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                   $ 20.00    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                $ 25,428.50                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       April 9, 2021 
Matter No. 105178                       Invoice No. 472658 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Jason H. Ballum 2.00 315.00 630.00 
Bradford A. King 13.40 350.00 4,690.00 
Lloyd Lee Byrd 32.40 350.00 11,340.00 
Nicole S. Cheuk 25.30 315.00 7,969.50 
Kimberly A. Paulsrud 4.10 190.00 779.00 

TOTALS 77.20  $ 25,408.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/12/21 BAK Emails  initial research  
call to Ms. Schaefer. 

1.80 630.00 

3/14/21 NSC Review of various emails from Attorney King and FCPS staff  
 

.20 63.00 

3/15/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer  call to Ms. Schaefer re: same 
 call to Attorney Foster. 

.60 210.00 

3/15/21 LLB Analyzed  
 

 

2.40 840.00 

3/15/21 NSC Review  analysis of same, email to Attorney Byrd  
 

2.00 630.00 

3/16/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mail from Ms. Schaefer  
 

 e-mail to/from Attorney Foster's office  
 

2.50 875.00 

3/16/21 LLB Worked  analyzed  
 

 

2.20 770.00 

3/16/21 NSC Phone call with Attorneys King and Byrd in regard to next steps  
gathered relevant information  

 

2.30 724.50 

3/17/21 BAK E-mails from team members  .40 140.00 

3/17/21 LLB Analyzed  
; reviewed worked 

on response  reviewed docket  

2.90 1,015.00 

3/17/21 NSC Continued review and analysis of complaint .30 94.50 

3/18/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer and administrators ; 
conference call with educators  

1.50 525.00 
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Client No. 022203                       April 9, 2021 
Matter No. 105178                       Invoice No. 472658 
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Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/18/21 LLB Worked on response  
 

1.20 420.00 

3/18/21 NSC Emails/phone call to D. Schaefer  
 participated in meeting with staff, continued review of complaint, 

preparation  participated in meeting with Attorneys King 
and Byrd, began research  

5.10 1,606.50 

3/18/21 KAP Analyze  telephone call  
 

.30 57.00 

3/19/21 BAK Confer with Attorney Cheuk  
review research  

.30 105.00 

3/19/21 LLB Updated Litigation Plan; analyzed  
 

 

3.90 1,365.00 

3/19/21 NSC Review  
 

3.00 945.00 

3/19/21 KAP Telephone conference with court clerk and judge's chambers regarding release of 
complaint and exhibits 

.40 76.00 

3/21/21 BAK Analyze  .40 140.00 

3/22/21 BAK Research  calls and e-mails to 
Attorneys Kennedy and Foster  

1.20 420.00 

3/22/21 LLB Worked telephone call to federal court case 
manager re: exhibits and transcripts received by the court; worked on motion to 
extend time; worked on supporting brief; legal research; worked on declaration of 
client; worked  

5.30 1,855.00 

3/22/21 NSC Continued research  conference call with Attorneys 
Ballum, Byrd and King in regard to same and next steps 

4.50 1,417.50 

3/22/21 JHB Conference with Mr. King and Ms. Cheuk  
analyze research  

; draft correspondences to Mr. King and Ms. Cheuk 

1.70 535.50 

3/23/21 BAK Review/revise draft motion to extend time, brief in support, and related 
declaration; e-mails to/from Attorney Kennedy re: same; confer with Attorney Byrd 
re: filing issues. 

1.20 420.00 

3/23/21 LLB Completed work on motion, brief, declaration; correspondence with client re: 
 telephone call with court re: sealed 

transcripts and exhibits 

3.70 1,295.00 

3/23/21 NSC Review of email communications regarding pleadings, review/analysis of drafts for 
motion, attachments 

1.40 441.00 

3/23/21 JHB Review multiple correspondences from Mr. Byrd; review multiple correspondences 
from Mr. King; draft correspondence to Mr. Byrd, Mr. King, and Ms. Cheuk 

; review correspondence from Mr. King 

.30 94.50 
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Matter No. 105178                       Invoice No. 472658 
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Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

3/23/21 KAP Prepare declaration exhibits; electronically file motion for extension, memorandum 
in support, attachments, and waiver of oral argument 

.90 171.00 

3/24/21 BAK E-mail to Ms. Schaefer  .10 35.00 

3/24/21 BAK Additional analysis  .70 245.00 

3/24/21 LLB Provided status update; supervised provision of required copies of pleadings to 
Chambers of Judge Trenga; legal research; telephone call with Case Manager re: 
seal exhibits; worked  

3.70 1,295.00 

3/24/21 NSC Review of NOA, email from FCPS staff in regard to litigation, began drafting 
responsive pleading, meeting with Attorneys Byrd and King in regard to same 

1.10 346.50 

3/24/21 KAP Draft notices of appearance for B. King and N. Cheuk; email to client regarding 
courtesy copies of filed pleadings to judge 

.90 171.00 

3/25/21 BAK Review order granting motion for extension of time; e-mail to Ms. Schaefer and 
Attorneys Kennedy and Falconi re: same; strategize  

 

.90 315.00 

3/25/21 LLB Worked  
 telephone call with law clerk re: status of motion to extend time; telephone 

call with case manager  reviewed order 
granting extension of time to file respond to the First Amended Complaint 

3.90 1,365.00 

3/25/21 NSC Prepared , conference call with 
Attorneys Byrd and King in regard to same and next steps, review of order in regard 
to motion for extension of time 

4.20 1,323.00 

3/26/21 NSC Continued preparing  .80 252.00 

3/30/21 BAK Review/revise  
e-mail to administration and in-house counsel re: same; review initial working 

draft of Memorandum in Support of Motion to Dismiss. 

1.40 490.00 

3/30/21 LLB Worked  
 

 

1.40 490.00 

3/30/21 NSC Review and revision to motion and memorandum in regard to exhibits, discussion 
with Attorney King  

.40 126.00 

3/31/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mails from Attorney Falconi and Ms. Schaefer re: draft Motion 
and supporting memorandum; confer with Attorney Byrd re: revision to same; 
review Order re: same; e-mail to clients re: same. 

.40 140.00 

3/31/21 LLB Worked on and filed motion and brief  
 analyze  

 

1.80 630.00 

3/31/21 KAP Revise motion, memorandum and waiver; electronically file motion, memorandum 
and notice; draft correspondence to Judge Trenga; email pro se plaintiffs all 
pleadings filed 

1.60 304.00 

 



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       April 9, 2021 
Matter No. 105178                       Invoice No. 472658 
 

5 
 

  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                    $ 25,408.50  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
3/23/21 COPIES 80.00 20.00 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                   $ 20.00    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                $ 25,428.50                
  













  

  
  

 
  

   

    
  

  
  
  

  
 

 

 
      

           
   

      

 

 

    











  

  
  

  
  

   

        
  

  
  
  

  
 

 

        
      

           
   

   

     

  
 

      



  

  
  

 
  

   
     

    

   
          

      
          

   
  

    
        

       
  

           
     















  

  
  

  
  

   

     
  

  
  
  

  
 

 

 
                          

     

        
  

 

 

 

 

 

        

   

 











  

  
  

 
  

   

     
  

  
  
  

  
 

 

        

       

 

 

       

  

  











  

  
  

  
  

   

   
     

   

 

  
    

  
    

   
  

   

     











  

  
  

  
  

    
  

 

 

 

 

  
   



   

     
     

        

   

     
            

  

 

    

 

 













  

     
     

  

    

  

 

   
            

  

 

    

 

 







  

  
  

 
  

   

  
   

  

   
 

  

 

 

  
 

  

    
   

  

    

 

 









  

  
  

  
  

  

           

  

       

 

  

     
      

        
   

 

    

 

 







  

  
  

  
  

   
      

  
  

  
  

   

 

   

            
      

 

 

  

 
 

   

    

        
         

     



  

  
  

 
  

     

 

       

   

        

     
      

       
   

  

    





 

 

 
 
                                              July 6, 2020 
 
 
            Dr. Scott Brabrand, Superintendent          Invoice No.      429180 
            Fairfax County Public Schools               Client No.     022203 
            Gatehouse Administration Center             Matter No.     101495 
            8115 Gatehouse Road                         Billing Attorney:   BAK 
            Falls Church, VA  22042 
                                                                              
________________________________________________________________________________________ 
   

INVOICE SUMMARY   
 
 
For professional services rendered through June 30, 2020: 
 
RE:   - Due Process Hearing 
   
 
 Professional Services                   $ 234.50 
 Total Expenses                             $ .00  
 
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                       $ 234.50       
 
 
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 6, 2020 
Matter No. 101495                       Invoice No. 429180 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .70 335.00 234.50 

TOTALS .70  $ 234.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

6/01/20 BAK Emails from/to Ms. Schaefer and Attorney Waugh  
 

.20 67.00 

6/02/20 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Johnson, Dr. Strong, Ms. Schaefer and Attorney Waugh  
 

.20 67.00 

6/24/20 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Waugh and Ms. Schaefer  
 

.20 67.00 

6/30/20 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Waugh and Ms. Schaefer  .10 33.50 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 234.50  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 234.50                
  



 

 

 
                                              July 6, 2020 
 
Dr. Scott Brabrand, Superintendent                      Invoice No.      429180 
Fairfax County Public Schools                           Client No.     022203 
Gatehouse Administration Center                         Matter No.     101495 
8115 Gatehouse Road                                     Billing Attorney:   BAK 
Falls Church, VA  22042 
   

REMITTANCE PAGE                  
Please return this page with your payment.       

  
 
 BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE          $ 234.50  
 
 
   

TO PAY BY CHECK: 
Sands Anderson PC 

ATTN:  Accounts Receivable 
1111 East Main Street 
Post Office Box 1998 

Richmond VA 23218-1998 
 

TO PAY ONLINE: 
www.sandsanderson.com/client-pay/ 

 
TO PAY BY CREDIT CARD:    

 
______ VISA _____ MASTERCARD ______ AMEX ______DISCOVER   Amount: $_________________________ 
 
Card#: ___________________________________________  Exp Date: _______________ Security#: _______ 
 
Name on Card: ______________________________________  Credit Card Zip Code: ____________________ 
 
Authorized Signature: _______________________________________________________________________ 
  

If you have any questions, please contact our Accounting Department at (804) 648-1636, 
or by e-mail at Payments@SandsAnderson.com 

 
All bills payable within 30 days of invoice date. 

 Thank you for choosing Sands Anderson PC.    



 

 

 
 
                                              July 6, 2020 
 
 
            Dr. Scott Brabrand, Superintendent          Invoice No.      429181 
            Fairfax County Public Schools               Client No.     022203 
            Gatehouse Administration Center             Matter No.     102110 
            8115 Gatehouse Road                         Billing Attorney:   BAK 
            Falls Church, VA  22042 
                                                                              
________________________________________________________________________________________ 
   

INVOICE SUMMARY   
 
 
For professional services rendered through June 30, 2020: 
 
RE:   - Student 
   
 
 Professional Services                $ 41,539.00 
 Total Expenses                        $ 2,814.50  
 
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                    $ 44,353.50       
 
 
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 6, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 429181 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 36.20 335.00 12,127.00 
Nicole S. Cheuk 97.80 300.00 29,340.00 
Kimberly A. Paulsrud .40 180.00 72.00 

TOTALS 134.40  $ 41,539.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

6/01/20 NSC Continued  
 

3.20 960.00 

6/02/20 BAK Review petitioners' Motion to Reconsider Subpoena Duces Tecum (.2); conference 
call with Ms. Schaefer  (.5). 

.70 234.50 

6/02/20 NSC Review of reconsideration motion filed by parent (.4), analysis of same (.7), 
 (.9); check in call with D. 

Schaefer regarding same (.4); began drafting response to motion to reconsider (.4) 

2.80 840.00 

6/03/20 NSC Drafted  4.30 1,290.00 

6/03/20 KAP Review  draft  
 

.40 72.00 

6/04/20 BAK Review/revise draft status report (.2); review revise draft response to motion to 
reconsider (.2); conference call with Ms. Schaefer  (.3). 

.70 234.50 

6/04/20 NSC Review and response to emails from FCPS staff  (.1), status phone 
call with D. Schaefer  (.3), finalized same (2.1) 

2.50 750.00 

6/05/20 BAK Review hearing officer's decision on special plea and demurrer, and e-mail to Ms. 
Schaefer re: same (.2); review hearing officer's decision on motion to reconsider 
issuance of subpeona (.1); research  (.7). 

1.00 335.00 

6/05/20 NSC Finalized all documents and records for submission to C.  (.7), finalized 
pleadings (.8), correspondence regarding same (.3), review of hearing officer 
decisions (.2), emails to Hearing Officer in regard to records status report (.2) 

2.20 660.00 

6/06/20 BAK Email from advocate  .10 33.50 

6/08/20 NSC Review of emails from hearing officer Mitchell  (.2), email to 
hearing officer regarding response to motion (.1), email to D. Schaefer in regard to 
same (.1), review  (.8) 

1.20 360.00 

6/09/20 BAK Conference call with Ms. Schaefer and Attorney Cheuk post pre-hearing conference 
call (.3); coordinate logistics  

(.1). 

.40 134.00 

6/09/20 NSC Reviewed  (.5), Participated in prehearing 
conference call (.7), finalized exhibit binders pursuant to 6/5 order (2.6) 

3.80 1,140.00 



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 6, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 429181 
 

3 
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

6/10/20 BAK Review  
(.2); review  (.3). 

.50 167.50 

6/10/20 NSC Reviewed  
 

5.50 1,650.00 

6/11/20 BAK Review e-mail from hearing officer re: petitioners' subpeona. .10 33.50 

6/11/20 NSC Continued review  3.40 1,020.00 

6/12/20 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Amos and Ms. Schaefer  .30 100.50 

6/12/20 NSC Continued review  
 

.60 180.00 

6/13/20 NSC Reviewed  1.30 390.00 

6/14/20 NSC Continued  2.50 750.00 

6/15/20 NSC Continued review  (4.9), email to team 
members  (.1) 

5.00 1,500.00 

6/16/20 BAK E-mails from/to hearing officer and Ms. Lucas re: status of subpoena (.2); plan for 
hearing preparation (.3). 

.50 167.50 

6/16/20 NSC Review  (4.5), review and response to correspondence regarding 
Petitioner's SDT (.3) 

4.80 1,440.00 

6/17/20 NSC Continued reviewing  3.00 900.00 

6/18/20 BAK Review e-mail from Ms. Lucas  (.1); review 
draft second exhibit binder (.3); strategize  (.6). 

1.00 335.00 

6/18/20 NSC Drafted email to hearing officer  (.2), phone call with D. Schaefer 
 (.5), completed exhibit binder #2 (2.0), 

completed review  (3.0) 

5.70 1,710.00 

6/19/20 BAK Multiple e-mails from/to Hearing Officer and Ms. Lucas re: status of subpoena (.4); 
review pre-hearing order in support of same (.2). 

.60 201.00 

6/19/20 NSC Completed , submitted email to hearing officer in regard to same (.4), 
review of various communication from parent advocate and hearing officer, 
response to same (.3) 

.70 210.00 

6/20/20 NSC Analysis  3.10 930.00 

6/22/20 BAK Finalizing exhibit binders. 1.70 569.50 

6/22/20 NSC Analysis  3.30 990.00 

6/23/20 NSC Analysis  analysis  3.70 1,110.00 

6/24/20 BAK Call to Ms. Schaefer  (.3); 
pre-hearing conference call (.4); initial research  

 (1.0); conference call with Ms. Schaefer  (.7). 

2.90 971.50 

6/24/20 NSC Continued analysis  (.3), prepared witness outlines (3.5), 
participated in prehearing conference call (.9), initial witness prep by phone 
conference (1.0) 

5.80 1,740.00 



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 6, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 429181 
 

4 
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

6/25/20 BAK Review/reply to e-mail  (.1); review  
(.1); continue drafting 

 (2.1); e-mails from/to advocate and Hearing Officer re: virtual 
hearing requirement and pending motions to exclude (.3); revise one of four e-mail 
exhibit binders (1.3). 

3.90 1,306.50 

6/25/20 NSC Witness outline preparation(6.7), review and revision to motion(.3), review of 
email communications between the parties (.2) 

7.20 2,160.00 

6/26/20 BAK Prepare witness examinations (4.0); finalize two exhibit binders (.7). 4.70 1,574.50 

6/26/20 NSC Prepared witness outlines 3.20 960.00 

6/27/20 BAK Research (3.3); review proposed draft IEP addendum (.1). 3.40 1,139.00 

6/27/20 NSC Prepared witness outlines 1.50 450.00 

6/28/20 BAK Prepare witness outlines. 3.80 1,273.00 

6/28/20 NSC Prepared witness outlines 1.60 480.00 

6/29/20 BAK Witness preparation (6.60); review/reply to e-mail froms Ms. Lucas and hearing 
officer  (.3). 

6.90 2,311.50 

6/29/20 NSC Witness preparation (6.0); prepared witness outlines (2.3) 8.30 2,490.00 

6/30/20 BAK Witness preparation. 3.00 1,005.00 

6/30/20 NSC Finalized Volumes I-VI of exhibits (1.5), prepared witness outlines (2.1), prepared 
with witness (4.0) 

7.60 2,280.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                    $ 41,539.00  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
5/20/20 Richmond Express, Inc., MESSENGER SERVICE, Period Ending: 05/15/20, 

5/20/2020, Dawn Schaefer 
 210.00 

6/01/20 Courier One, SERVICE FEES, Period Ending 6/1/2020 - 6/1/2020, 6/1/2020, 
Sterling Speech & Language 

 165.00 

6/11/20 COPIES 1754.00 438.50 
6/11/20 BINDERS 2.00 4.00 
6/18/20 COPIES 1546.00 386.50 
6/18/20 BINDERS 2.00 4.00 
6/25/20 COPIES, 78 @ .25/Copy 78.00 19.50 
6/25/20 COPIES, 3 @ .25/Copy 3.00 .75 
6/26/20 COPIES 2403.00 600.75 
6/26/20 BINDERS 6.00 12.00 
6/30/20 COPIES 2298.00 574.50 
6/30/20 COPIES 1524.00 381.00 
6/30/20 COLOR COPIES 3.00 3.00 
6/30/20 COLOR COPIES 3.00 3.00 
6/30/20 BINDERS 3.00 6.00 



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 6, 2020 
Matter No. 102110                       Invoice No. 429181 
 

5 
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
6/30/20 BINDERS 3.00 6.00 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                $ 2,814.50    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                $ 44,353.50                
  



 

 

 
                                              July 6, 2020 
 
Dr. Scott Brabrand, Superintendent                      Invoice No.      429181 
Fairfax County Public Schools                           Client No.     022203 
Gatehouse Administration Center                         Matter No.     102110 
8115 Gatehouse Road                                     Billing Attorney:   BAK 
Falls Church, VA  22042 
   

REMITTANCE PAGE                  
Please return this page with your payment.       

  
 
 BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE       $ 44,353.50  
 
 
   

TO PAY BY CHECK: 
Sands Anderson PC 

ATTN:  Accounts Receivable 
1111 East Main Street 
Post Office Box 1998 

Richmond VA 23218-1998 
 

TO PAY ONLINE: 
www.sandsanderson.com/client-pay/ 

 
TO PAY BY CREDIT CARD:    

 
______ VISA _____ MASTERCARD ______ AMEX ______DISCOVER   Amount: $_________________________ 
 
Card#: ___________________________________________  Exp Date: _______________ Security#: _______ 
 
Name on Card: ______________________________________  Credit Card Zip Code: ____________________ 
 
Authorized Signature: _______________________________________________________________________ 
  

If you have any questions, please contact our Accounting Department at (804) 648-1636, 
or by e-mail at Payments@SandsAnderson.com 

 
All bills payable within 30 days of invoice date. 

 Thank you for choosing Sands Anderson PC.    



 

 

 
 
                                              August 5, 2020 
 
 
            Dr. Scott Brabrand, Superintendent          Invoice No.      436832 
            Fairfax County Public Schools               Client No.     022203 
            Gatehouse Administration Center             Matter No.     101495 
            8115 Gatehouse Road                         Billing Attorney:   BAK 
            Falls Church, VA  22042 
                                                                              
________________________________________________________________________________________ 
   

INVOICE SUMMARY   
 
 
For professional services rendered through July 31, 2020: 
 
RE:   - Due Process Hearing 
   
 
 Professional Services                   $ 469.00 
 Total Expenses                             $ .00  
 
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                       $ 469.00       
 
 Previous Balance                   $ 234.50  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE           $ 703.50              
 
 
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2020 
Matter No. 101495                       Invoice No. 436832 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 1.40 335.00 469.00 

TOTALS 1.40  $ 469.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

7/01/20 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Johnson and Attorney Belkowitz  
 

.20 67.00 

7/09/20 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer's office and Attorney Waugh  
 

.20 67.00 

7/14/20 BAK E-mails from/to administrators and Attorney Waugh  
. 

.20 67.00 

7/20/20 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Waugh and administrators  
 

.20 67.00 

7/21/20 BAK E-mails from/to administration and Attorney Waugh  
 

.20 67.00 

7/23/20 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Waugh and call to Ms. Schaefer  .30 100.50 

7/24/20 BAK E-mail from/to Ms. Schaefer  .10 33.50 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 469.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 469.00                
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2020 
Matter No. 101495                       Invoice No. 436832 
 

3 
 

  
OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
 
Invoice Number Date Invoice 

   Total 
Payments 

   Received 
Ending 

   Balance 
429180 7/06/20 234.50 .00 234.50 
 
 
 Previous Balance          $ 234.50 
 
 Balance Due This Invoice           $ 469.00  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE           $ 703.50     
  



 

 

 
                                              August 5, 2020 
 
Dr. Scott Brabrand, Superintendent                      Invoice No.      436832 
Fairfax County Public Schools                           Client No.     022203 
Gatehouse Administration Center                         Matter No.     101495 
8115 Gatehouse Road                                     Billing Attorney:   BAK 
Falls Church, VA  22042 
   

REMITTANCE PAGE                  
Please return this page with your payment.       

  
 
 BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE          $ 469.00  
 
 Previous Balance           $ 234.50  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE           $ 703.50   
 
 
   

TO PAY BY CHECK: 
Sands Anderson PC 

ATTN:  Accounts Receivable 
1111 East Main Street 
Post Office Box 1998 

Richmond VA 23218-1998 
 

TO PAY ONLINE: 
www.sandsanderson.com/client-pay/ 

 
TO PAY BY CREDIT CARD:    

 
______ VISA _____ MASTERCARD ______ AMEX ______DISCOVER   Amount: $_________________________ 
 
Card#: ___________________________________________  Exp Date: _______________ Security#: _______ 
 
Name on Card: ______________________________________  Credit Card Zip Code: ____________________ 
 
Authorized Signature: _______________________________________________________________________ 
  

If you have any questions, please contact our Accounting Department at (804) 648-1636, 
or by e-mail at Payments@SandsAnderson.com 

 
All bills payable within 30 days of invoice date. 

 Thank you for choosing Sands Anderson PC.    









































 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 097716                       Invoice No. 458156 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 2.20 335.00 737.00 

TOTALS 2.20  $ 737.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

12/01/20 BAK Finalize Title IX presentation materials; e-mail to Attorney Kennedy. .40 134.00 

12/03/20 BAK Prepare for and present at school board meeting re: Title IX issues. 1.80 603.00 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 737.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 737.00                
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 097716                       Invoice No. 458156 
 

3 
 

  
OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
 
Invoice Number Date Invoice 

   Total 
Payments 

   Received 
Ending 

   Balance 
453444 12/08/20 670.00 .00 670.00 
 
 
 Previous Balance          $ 670.00 
 
 Balance Due This Invoice           $ 737.00  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE         $ 1,407.00     
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 103416                       Invoice No. 458158 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 4.90 335.00 1,641.50 

TOTALS 4.90  $ 1,641.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

12/01/20 BAK Review ; calls to/from Attorney Kennedy re: exhibits; e-mails re: 
; begin preparing exhibit binder; e-mail to Attorney 

Kennedy and Ms. Carroll re: same. 

3.60 1,206.00 

12/02/20 BAK E-mails from grievant, hearing officer and Attorney Kennedy re: request for 
continuance; call to Attorney Kennedy re: same. 

.20 67.00 

12/03/20 BAK E-mail from hearing officer granting extension. .10 33.50 

12/07/20 BAK E-mail from  re: hearing schedule. .10 33.50 

12/08/20 BAK E-mail from/to Attorney Kennedy  
 

.10 33.50 

12/09/20 BAK E-mails to/from Attorney Kennedy, hearing officer and  re: new hearing 
date. 

.30 100.50 

12/14/20 BAK Conference call with Attorney Kennedy and Ms. Carroll . .40 134.00 

12/19/20 BAK E-mail from Attorney Kennedy . .10 33.50 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                     $ 1,641.50  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                 $ 1,641.50                
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 103416                       Invoice No. 458158 
 

3 
 

  
OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
 
Invoice Number Date Invoice 

   Total 
Payments 

   Received 
Ending 

   Balance 
453446 12/08/20 2,278.00 .00 2,278.00 
 
 
 Previous Balance        $ 2,278.00 
 
 Balance Due This Invoice         $ 1,641.50  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE         $ 3,919.50     
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 104432                       Invoice No. 458159 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 1.80 335.00 603.00 

TOTALS 1.80  $ 603.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

12/01/20 BAK E-mails to/from Attorney DeFede . .20 67.00 

12/03/20 BAK Call and e-mails from/to Attorney DeFede  
; e-mails to/from Ms. Schaefer re: same. 

.50 167.50 

12/04/20 BAK Email from Attorney DeFede. .10 33.50 

12/07/20 BAK Calls from/to Attorney DeFede and Ms. Schaefer  .40 134.00 

12/08/20 BAK E-mails from Attorney DeFede and to Ms. Schaefer . .10 33.50 

12/09/20 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney DeFede and Ms. Schaefer  
. 

.10 33.50 

12/11/20 BAK Call to Ms. Schaefer re: ; email from Ms. Schaefer and to 
Attorney DeFede re: same. 

.10 33.50 

12/17/20 BAK E-mail to Attorney DeFede re: . .10 33.50 

12/18/20 BAK E-mail from/to hearing officer re: . .10 33.50 

12/19/20 BAK Review dismissal order and e-mail from hearing officer. .10 33.50 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 603.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 603.00                
  



 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       January 12, 2021 
Matter No. 104432                       Invoice No. 458159 
 

3 
 

  
OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
 
Invoice Number Date Invoice 

   Total 
Payments 

   Received 
Ending 

   Balance 
453447 12/08/20 12,682.50 .00 12,682.50 
 
 
 Previous Balance       $ 12,682.50 
 
 Balance Due This Invoice           $ 603.00  
 
 TOTAL BALANCE DUE        $ 13,285.50     
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       February 3, 2021 
Matter No. 097716                       Invoice No. 462922 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .30 335.00 100.50 
Nicole S. Cheuk .20 300.00 60.00 

TOTALS .50  $ 160.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

1/07/21 BAK Call from Attorney Kennedy re: Title IX investigation/document issue. .30 100.50 

1/07/21 NSC Phone call with E. Kennedy in regard to Title IX issue .20 60.00 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 160.50  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 160.50                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       February 3, 2021 
Matter No. 101495                       Invoice No. 462923 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .90 335.00 301.50 

TOTALS .90  $ 301.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

1/25/21 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Waugh and Ms. Schaefer ; 
call from Mr. Halla re: same. 

.40 134.00 

2/01/21 BAK E-mails from/to Mr. Halla and Ms. Schaefer . .20 67.00 

2/02/21 BAK E-mails from/to Mr. Halla and Ms. Schaefer  
; e-mail to Attorney Waugh re: same. 

.30 100.50 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 301.50  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 301.50                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       February 3, 2021 
Matter No. 103416                       Invoice No. 462925 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .40 335.00 134.00 

TOTALS .40  $ 134.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

1/12/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mail from Attorney Kennedy  
 

.10 33.50 

1/14/21 BAK E-mails from/to  and hearing officer re: dismissal order. .10 33.50 

1/26/21 BAK E-mail and call from Ms. Kennedy re: employee's communication to hearing officer. .20 67.00 
 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 134.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 134.00                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       March 4, 2021 
Matter No. 097716                       Invoice No. 467806 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .90 335.00 301.50 

TOTALS .90  $ 301.50 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

2/05/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mail from Ms. Amos re: parent request for additional meeting. .10 33.50 

2/16/21 BAK Conference call with Ms. Schaefer and other administrators re:  
 

.40 134.00 

2/24/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mail from Ms. Schaefer re:  .10 33.50 

2/25/21 BAK Review/reply to e-mail from Ms. Schaefer re:  
 

.30 100.50 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 301.50  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 301.50                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       June 3, 2021 
Matter No. 097716                       Invoice No. 482220 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King .30 350.00 105.00 

TOTALS .30  $ 105.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

5/28/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer  review documentation re: 
same. 

.30 105.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 105.00  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
5/28/21 COPIES 93.00 23.25 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                   $ 23.25    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 128.25                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 2, 2021 
Matter No. 105717                       Invoice No. 486978 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 2.50 350.00 875.00 

TOTALS 2.50  $ 875.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

6/08/21 BAK E-mails and call from/to Attorney Kennedy; begin review of file. .40 140.00 

6/09/21 BAK E-mail from Attorney Kennedy . .10 35.00 

6/12/21 BAK Review personnel file; e-mail to Attorney Kennedy re: same. .80 280.00 

6/14/21 BAK E-mail from/to Attorney Kennedy  
 review e-mail from Ms. Kennedy 

; review same. 

.30 105.00 

6/15/21 BAK E-mail from/to Attorney Kennedy , .10 35.00 

6/17/21 BAK E-mail from Attorney Kennedy re: additional personnel records; initial review of 
same. 

.30 105.00 

6/22/21 BAK E-mail to Attorney Kennedy re . .10 35.00 

6/25/21 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Kennedy re:  
 

.10 35.00 

6/28/21 BAK E-mail to Ms.  Carroll re: . .10 35.00 

6/29/21 BAK E-mails to/from Attorney Kennedy re:  
 

.20 70.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 875.00  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
6/08/21 COPIES 208.00 52.00 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                   $ 52.00    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 927.00                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       July 2, 2021 
Matter No. 105717                       Invoice No. 486978 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 2.50 350.00 875.00 

TOTALS 2.50  $ 875.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

6/08/21 BAK E-mails and call from/to Attorney Kennedy; begin review of file. .40 140.00 

6/09/21 BAK E-mail from Attorney Kennedy re: . .10 35.00 

6/12/21 BAK Review personnel file; e-mail to Attorney Kennedy re: same. .80 280.00 

6/14/21 BAK E-mail from/to Attorney Kennedy re:  
; review e-mail from Ms. Kennedy re: 

; review same. 

.30 105.00 

6/15/21 BAK E-mail from/to Attorney Kennedy re: , .10 35.00 

6/17/21 BAK E-mail from Attorney Kennedy re: additional personnel records; initial review of 
same. 

.30 105.00 

6/22/21 BAK E-mail to Attorney Kennedy re: . .10 35.00 

6/25/21 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Kennedy re:  
 

.10 35.00 

6/28/21 BAK E-mail to Ms.  Carroll re: . .10 35.00 

6/29/21 BAK E-mails to/from Attorney Kennedy re:  
 

.20 70.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 875.00  
 
EXPENSES                          
 

Date Description Qty Amount 
6/08/21 COPIES 208.00 52.00 

 
  TOTAL EXPENSES                                   $ 52.00    
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 927.00                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2021 
Matter No. 105821                       Invoice No. 491720 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 1.30 350.00 455.00 

TOTALS 1.30  $ 455.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

7/07/21 BAK Call to Ms. Schaefer re: status. .10 35.00 

7/09/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer and Attorney Belkowitz re: status. .10 35.00 

7/13/21 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Belkowitz. .10 35.00 

7/30/21 BAK Email from Attorney Belkowitz and call to Ms. Schaefer. .20 70.00 

7/31/21 BAK Review documentation ; call to Ms. 
Schaefer re: same; email Attorney Belkowitz. 

.80 280.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 455.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 455.00                
  







 

            SANDS ANDERSON PC                                     
 
Client No. 022203                       August 5, 2021 
Matter No. 105821                       Invoice No. 491720 
 

2 
 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                                 
 
Name Hours Rate Total 
Bradford A. King 1.30 350.00 455.00 

TOTALS 1.30  $ 455.00 
 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES              
 

Date Init Description of Service Hours Amount 

7/07/21 BAK Call to Ms. Schaefer re: status. .10 35.00 

7/09/21 BAK E-mails from/to Ms. Schaefer and Attorney Belkowitz re: status. .10 35.00 

7/13/21 BAK E-mails from/to Attorney Belkowitz. .10 35.00 

7/30/21 BAK Email from Attorney Belkowitz and call to Ms. Schaefer. .20 70.00 

7/31/21 BAK Review documentation ; call to Ms. 
Schaefer re: same; email Attorney Belkowitz. 

.80 280.00 

 
  TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES                       $ 455.00  
 
    
 TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE                   $ 455.00                
  






