

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 27

RE: (Hunton # 037077.000055) Production and Recovery of FOIA Records

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2021

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/16/2021	S E HAYNIE	Calls and correspondence with E Kennedy; draft letters [REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	1.25
09/17/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Conference call with Ms. Podolny, Ms. Haynie, and Ms. Rewari to discuss background, strategy, and tasks; telephone call with Mr. Shebelskie to discuss [REDACTED] review background information provided by Ms. Podolny and Ms. Haynie; [REDACTED]	3.25
09/17/2021	S E HAYNIE	Calls and correspondence with E Kennedy re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] calls and correspondence with S Rewari, M Kinney, D Fairbanks, M Podolny re [REDACTED] and research re: same; call to M Shannon re: background and copies of records; transmit same to working group; draft message to P Tiao seeking input	6.50
09/17/2021	M A PODOLNY	Calls with counsel regarding [REDACTED] and research on the same	2.50
09/17/2021	S REWARI	Call with S. Haynie regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] call with M. Podolny, S. Haynie, and D. Fairbanks regarding same,	0.50
09/18/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Research [REDACTED] including [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review correspondence from [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review additional background information provided by Ms. Haynie; review and respond to recommendations by Mr. Tiao	4.00
09/18/2021	S E HAYNIE	Call and correspond with E Kennedy; provide updates to D Fairbanks, et al.; assemble and review documents; draft and share [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review and respond to messages re: [REDACTED] calls and correspondence with P Tiao, S Rewari, others	8.00
09/18/2021	S REWARI	Call with E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] call with S. Haynie regarding same; review cases on [REDACTED]	1.00
09/19/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Review additional case law [REDACTED]	1.00
09/19/2021	S E HAYNIE	Follow up with Cognicion on [REDACTED] review of [REDACTED] review and share case relating to [REDACTED] correspond re: [REDACTED] call from E Kennedy	2.25

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 28

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/19/2021	S REWARI	Calls with E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED] call with L. Marshall and E. Kennedy regarding same.	0.50
09/20/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Review [REDACTED] provided by Ms. Haynie; conduct additional research on [REDACTED]; draft Complaint	6.75
09/20/2021	S E HAYNIE	Multiple calls and correspondence with E Kennedy, K Ott (Cognicion), S Rewari, D Fairbanks [REDACTED] meet with Cognicion team and E Kennedy re: same; review/QC [REDACTED]; review and revise draft Complaint	7.50
09/20/2021	L C MARSHALL	Review [REDACTED] and attention to email correspondence regarding the same.	0.75
09/21/2021	R M BATES	Telephone call with S. Rewari regarding background of matter; telephone call with E. Kennedy regarding same; review and revise [REDACTED] e-mail correspondence with H Belkowitz regarding same; review [REDACTED] e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]	1.00
09/21/2021	S E HAYNIE	QC [REDACTED]; call from Ms Rewari re: Complaint and directions to revise same; multiple calls and correspondence with Cognicion; conference with E Kennedy and S Rewari and update D Fairbanks and M Podolny re: same; revise [REDACTED]; continue QC process; transmit background to R Bates	8.00
09/21/2021	S REWARI	Review draft complaint; call with S. Haynie regarding same; call with S. Haynie regarding strategy; call with E. Kennedy and S. Haynie regarding strategy; call with L. Marshall regarding [REDACTED]; call with R. Bates to explain issues; call with R. Bates and E. Kennedy regarding strategy.	1.50

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 29

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/22/2021	R M BATES	Conduct research [REDACTED] consult with D. Fairbanks regarding prior research of claims and [REDACTED] consult with S. Haynie regarding background of matter; review various case documents and chronology; telephone call with H. Belkowitz regarding [REDACTED] e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy [REDACTED] consult with A. Schmalz regarding [REDACTED]; review various correspondence related to [REDACTED] and related issues; multiple telephone calls to D. Tisler; prepare correspondence to D. Tisler [REDACTED] consult with S. Rewari regarding same; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster and E. Kennedy [REDACTED] finalize correspondence to D. Tisler; consult with D. Fairbanks and S. Haynie regarding various case updates; review e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy [REDACTED] review draft of complaint	6.25
09/22/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Phone call with Mr. Bates to discuss case status and strategy and tasks going forward; revise Complaint to [REDACTED] review additional background information; draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction; draft Memorandum in support of Motion for Preliminary Injunction	8.25
09/22/2021	S E HAYNIE	Correspond with E Kennedy and C Baroody [REDACTED] correspond (multiple) with R Bates; review/revise letters to FOIA recipient and H Belkowitz; review and transmit to Cognicion [REDACTED] transmit message to working group showing that [REDACTED] multiple calls and emails re: [REDACTED]	7.25
09/22/2021	S REWARI	Review draft letter; call with R. Bates regarding same.	0.25
09/23/2021	R M BATES	Review [REDACTED] meeting with Mr. Foster and Ms. Kennedy [REDACTED] telephone calls to D. Tisler regarding [REDACTED] prepare correspondence to D. Tisler regarding same; consult with D. Fairbanks and S. Haynie regarding various case matters and complaint; review and revise draft of complaint; consult with team regarding same	5.50

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 30

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/23/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Research and draft [REDACTED] for Complaint	1.00
09/23/2021	S E HAYNIE	Correspond and calls with Cognicion and working group; meeting with J Foster, E Kennedy, S Rewari, R Bates [REDACTED] review and suggest revisions to pleadings; perform QC review of [REDACTED]	7.25
09/23/2021	M A PODOLNY	Calls to finalize production set	0.25
09/23/2021	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster, E. Kennedy, S. Haynie, and R. Bates [REDACTED]	0.75
09/24/2021	R M BATES	Review and revise draft of brief in support of motion for preliminary injunction; review and revise draft of complaint; consult with D. Fairbanks regarding [REDACTED] consult with S. Haynie regarding [REDACTED] consult with M. Winbush regarding same; consult with S. Rewari and S. Haynie regarding complaint revisions; review and revise draft of cover letter enclosing corrected FOIA production; coordinate with R. Boczkaj regarding preparations for complaint filing; consult with S. Rewari regarding [REDACTED]; review research related to same; conduct brief follow-up research on [REDACTED] consult with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED] e-mail correspondence with J. Foster regarding [REDACTED]	7.75
09/24/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Revise and incorporate edits into motion for preliminary injunction and memorandum in support thereof; research [REDACTED]; draft proposed order for preliminary injunction	4.50
09/24/2021	S E HAYNIE	Work with M Winbush and others to coordinate production of [REDACTED]; review and provide comments to Complaint; work with M Shannon to provide transmittal; review and revise [REDACTED] respond to multiple calls and emails; research/review [REDACTED]	3.50
09/24/2021	L C MARSHALL	Conference call with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	0.25

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 31

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/24/2021	S REWARI	Review and comment on draft complaint; emails with R. Bates and S. Haynie regarding draft complaint; review draft of PI brief; emails regarding same; [REDACTED] call with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; emails regarding same.	3.00
09/25/2021	R M BATES	Review e-mail correspondence from J. Foster regarding [REDACTED] telephone call with S. Rewari regarding strategy for same; consult with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding same; prepare [REDACTED] correspond with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding same; [REDACTED] consult with S. Haynie regarding [REDACTED]; conduct research on [REDACTED] revise draft of complaint [REDACTED] revise draft of preliminary injunction brief to [REDACTED]	5.50
09/25/2021	S E HAYNIE	Respond to messages regarding [REDACTED] review and summarize same	2.75
09/25/2021	S REWARI	Emails regarding [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] call with E. Kennedy regarding same; call with J. Foster regarding same; call with R. Bates and S. Haynie regarding next steps; edit [REDACTED] emails regarding same.	1.25
09/26/2021	R M BATES	Prepare [REDACTED] consult with S. Rewari, J. Foster, and E. Kennedy regarding same; telephone call with E. Kennedy regarding strategy; phone call with C. Oettinger regarding [REDACTED] consult with process server regarding service of letter; review and revise complaint; review and revise brief in support of preliminary injunction motion; telephone call with S. Haynie regarding various case matters; telephone call to C. Oettinger regarding [REDACTED] review various e-mails related to complaint edits	4.00
09/26/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review [REDACTED] and draft email responding to same with [REDACTED] complete review of [REDACTED]; review and propose edits to Complaint; correspond with working group and client	3.75
09/26/2021	S REWARI	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] edit draft letter; review draft complaint.	0.75

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 32

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/27/2021	R M BATES	Review affidavit of service; consult with R. Boczkaj-Gonzalez regarding brief review; consult with S. Rewari regarding review of various filings; consult with D. Fairbanks regarding additional research; prepare [REDACTED] finalize complaint, motion for preliminary injunction, brief in support of motion for preliminary injunction; review various filings associated with complaint filing; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster regarding [REDACTED] e-mail correspondence with J. Foster and E. Kennedy [REDACTED] attend to various correspondence related to case; conduct additional follow-up research	5.25
09/27/2021	R G BOCZKAJ-GONZALEZ	Review, bluebook, citecheck and proofread the current draft of Fairfax County School Board's Memorandum in Support of Emergency Motion for Preliminary Injunction.	1.50
09/27/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Research [REDACTED]	0.75
09/27/2021	S E HAYNIE	Multiple calls and messages with working group and with Cognicion [REDACTED] work on same	3.50
09/27/2021	S REWARI	Emails regarding draft complaint and filing; call with R. Bates; review and comment on draft PI brief; call with E. Kennedy [REDACTED]	0.75
09/28/2021	R M BATES	Conduct research [REDACTED] consult with S. Rewari and S. Haynie regarding same; coordinate service of various documents; revise brief in support of motion for preliminary injunction; prepare case strategy; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster and E. Kennedy [REDACTED] finalize various calendar control forms; coordinate various filings; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster [REDACTED] telephone call with Fairfax police regarding [REDACTED] prepare [REDACTED] review correspondence [REDACTED] prepare [REDACTED] finalize notice of appearance for calendar control; coordinate filing of related documents; review e-mail correspondence [REDACTED]; review and respond to [REDACTED]	8.25
09/28/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review and respond to matters [REDACTED] calls re: same	5.75

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 33

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/28/2021	L C MARSHALL	Attention to email correspondence and updates regarding [REDACTED]	0.50
09/28/2021	S REWARI	Call with R. Bates; emails regarding [REDACTED] call with S. Haynie; emails regarding [REDACTED]	0.50
09/29/2021	R M BATES	Consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy; consult with Mr. Fairbanks regarding [REDACTED] review and finalize certificate of mailing; consult with library regarding research needed for case; review correspondence from D. Tisler's potential counsel; e-mail correspondence with D. Tisler's counsel; review [REDACTED] meeting with J. Foster and E. Kennedy [REDACTED] multiple e-mail correspondence with C. Oettinger's counsel; review [REDACTED] and analyze [REDACTED]	5.00
09/29/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Research [REDACTED] draft Certificate of Mailing; research regarding [REDACTED]	2.50
09/29/2021	S E HAYNIE	Calls and correspondence [REDACTED] transmit [REDACTED] to Cognicion; review and respond to multiple questions [REDACTED]	3.00
09/29/2021	L C MARSHALL	Conference call with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	0.25
09/29/2021	S REWARI	Emails with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; call with J. Foster, E. Kennedy, R. Bates et al. regarding case and next steps; emails regarding same; call with E. Kennedy [REDACTED] emails regarding [REDACTED]	1.25

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 34

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
09/30/2021	R M BATES	Prepare for argument and hearing; telephone call with D. Tisler's counsel; telephone call with C. Oettinger's counsel; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding various filings; conduct research related to case; attend court hearing; telephone call with client regarding same; prepare draft consent order; consult with S. Rewari regarding same; e-mail correspondence with client regarding same; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding same; telephone call to D. Tisler's counsel; telephone call to C. Oettinger's counsel regarding same; review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepare for hearing; consult with S. Haynie and D. Fairbanks regarding [REDACTED] consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy; e-mail correspondence with C. Oettinger regarding [REDACTED] consult with client regarding [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepare case strategy	8.50
09/30/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Conduct initial research on [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.25
09/30/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review and respond to multiple inquiries [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] calls and correspondence [REDACTED] review files and update matter chronology for R Bates	6.50
09/30/2021	S REWARI	Call with defense counsel and court regarding scheduling; call with R. Bates regarding same; call with J. Foster, E. Kennedy, and R. Bates regarding [REDACTED] review and edit draft consent order; call with R. Bates regarding same; call with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED] call with defense counsel and court regarding [REDACTED] call with R. Bates regarding same; emails regarding [REDACTED]; calls with J. Foster and R. Bates; call with R. Bates; call with M. York and J. Foster regarding [REDACTED] review drafts; comment on same.	3.50
TOTAL HOURS			188.50

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102207206
DATE: 11/12/2021
PAGE: 35

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
R M BATES	Partner	57.00	750.00	42,750.00
L C MARSHALL	Partner	1.75	750.00	1,312.50
S REWARI	Partner	15.50	750.00	11,625.00
R D FAIRBANKS	Counsel	33.25	595.00	19,783.75
M A PODOLNY	Counsel	2.75	595.00	1,636.25
S E HAYNIE	Senior Associate	76.75	495.00	37,991.25
R G BOCZKAJ-GONZALEZ	Paralegal	1.50	205.00	307.50
TOTAL FEES (\$)				115,406.25

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

CODE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E107	Delivery/Messenger Services	194.57
E108	Postage	1.16
E112	Court Fees	89.44
E116	Trial Transcripts	150.00
E124	Other – Miscellaneous – Process Service	160.00
TOTAL CURRENT EXPENSES (\$)		595.17

MATTER SUMMARY:

Current Fees:	\$ 115,406.25
Current Charges:	595.17
CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:	\$ 116,001.42