

**RE: (Hunton # 037077.0000055) Production and Recovery of FOIA Records**

**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2021:**

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/01/2021	R M BATES	Consult with S. Haynie regarding [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]; review and revise [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy regarding same; telephone call with C. Oettinger's counsel regarding various issues; review [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with C. Oettinger's counsel regarding order; consult with S. Rewari regarding [REDACTED]; review research related to [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]	2.50
10/01/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Conduct research regarding [REDACTED]	1.25
10/01/2021	S E HAYNIE	Work on chronology; respond to emails re: related matters; review [REDACTED]	2.25
10/01/2021	S REWARI	Call with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]; emails regarding [REDACTED]; call with J. Foster	1.25
10/04/2021	R M BATES	Review [REDACTED]; consult with D. Fairbanks regarding same; prepare strategy regarding same; consult with S. Rewari regarding [REDACTED]	2.00
10/04/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Email correspondence with Mr. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; conduct additional research regarding same	1.00
10/04/2021	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster regarding next steps	0.25
10/05/2021	R M BATES	Consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy; review research [REDACTED]; consult with D. Fairbanks regarding same; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster regarding same; telephone call with J. Foster regarding case strategy; telephone call with new opposing counsel; consult with S. Rewari regarding same	2.25
10/05/2021	R D FAIRBANKS	Discussion with Mr. Bates regarding additional tasks; begin searching for [REDACTED]	0.25
10/05/2021	S E HAYNIE	Correspond re: [REDACTED]; participate in Teams call; review correspondence re: [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] and respond to E. Kennedy	1.50

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/05/2021	S REWARI	Call with R. Bates, J. Foster, and S. Haynie regarding next steps and [REDACTED]; emails with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; call with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; emails regarding same	0.75
10/06/2021	R M BATES	Review correspondence from opposing counsel; review research [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding calendar control; e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]; finalize [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster regarding case updates; consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy; review research related to [REDACTED]; review and revise [REDACTED]	3.50
10/06/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review and update chronology; correspond with R. Bates and E. Kennedy re: issues; draft, revise and transmit [REDACTED]	5.50
10/06/2021	S REWARI	Emails regarding [REDACTED]; call with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]	0.50
10/07/2021	R M BATES	E-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding filings; review [REDACTED]; coordinate additional research; consult with J. Foster regarding case strategy; review documents related to [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding pro hac motion	1.75
10/07/2021	S E HAYNIE	Correspond with E. Kennedy re: [REDACTED]; follow up with M Shannon; draft [REDACTED]	1.25
10/07/2021	S REWARI	Attend Calendar Control telephone appearance on Defendants' request for leave to file oversized brief; email regarding [REDACTED]; emails and calls regarding [REDACTED]; emails regarding [REDACTED]	1.25
10/08/2021	R M BATES	Coordinate [REDACTED]; consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy; review [REDACTED]; consult with T. Cox regarding [REDACTED]; review correspondence related to [REDACTED]; provide advice regarding same; review research [REDACTED]; prepare reply brief; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding pro hac order	6.75
10/08/2021	T S COX	Research [REDACTED]	2.00



DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/08/2021	S E HAYNIE	Calls and correspondence with E. Kennedy and M. Shannon; draft [REDACTED]; correspond with R. Bates and S. Rewari re: [REDACTED]; calls and correspondence re: same; finalize [REDACTED]	7.50
10/08/2021	S REWARI	Call with R. Bates regarding next steps and [REDACTED]	1.00
10/09/2021	S E HAYNIE	Calls and correspondence with Hunton support and process server (multiple); work on [REDACTED] and correspond with client re same	1.00
10/10/2021	T S COX	Review [REDACTED]	0.25
10/11/2021	R M BATES	Review research [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]; consult with T. Cox regarding same	7.50
10/11/2021	E C HENDERSON	Conduct legal research for [REDACTED]	1.50
10/12/2021	R M BATES	Prepare [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]; consult with T. Cox regarding same; review correspondence related to case; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster regarding [REDACTED]	2.00
10/12/2021	T S COX	Research re [REDACTED]	1.25
10/12/2021	E C HENDERSON	Continue conducting legal research for [REDACTED] summarize research	1.50
10/13/2021	R M BATES	Review correspondence and research from T. Cox	0.25
10/13/2021	T S COX	Draft parts of [REDACTED]	7.25
10/14/2021	R M BATES	Review and revise draft of [REDACTED]; consult with T. Cox regarding [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]; consult with S. Rewari regarding same; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding consent to video appearance	3.25
10/14/2021	R G BOCZKAJ-GONZALEZ	Review, bluebook, citecheck and proofread the current draft of Fairfax County School Board's Reply Memorandum in Support of Emergency Motion for Preliminary Injunction	3.00
10/14/2021	T S COX	Prepare portion of reply brief [REDACTED]	5.25
10/14/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review and provide comments to reply brief; correspond with R. Bates	0.25

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/14/2021	S REWARI	Review draft reply brief and [REDACTED] emails with R. Bates regarding draft	0.25
10/15/2021	R M BATES	Finalize reply brief [REDACTED] consult with S. Rewari and T. Cox regarding same; prepare for oral argument; consult with S. Haynie regarding same	1.75
10/15/2021	T S COX	Prepare revisions to reply [REDACTED]	0.50
10/15/2021	S REWARI	Review [REDACTED]; call with S. Haynie regarding same	0.50
10/16/2021	S E HAYNIE	Work on [REDACTED]; correspond with E. Kennedy re: same	0.50
10/18/2021	R M BATES	Review correspondence related to [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding calendar control call	0.25
10/19/2021	R M BATES	E-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]	0.25
10/20/2021	R M BATES	Telephone call with E. Kennedy and J. Foster regarding background information and strategy; consult with S. Haynie regarding [REDACTED]; consult with T. Cox regarding [REDACTED]	1.75
10/20/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review [REDACTED] es; communicate with E. Kennedy re: same; review materials to [REDACTED]; respond to questions from R. Bates	1.75
10/20/2021	S REWARI	Call with J. Foster, R. Bates, and E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]; emails regarding [REDACTED]	1.25
10/21/2021	R M BATES	Prepare for oral argument; consult with S. Haynie regarding same; consult with S. Rewari regarding same; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding same; prepare [REDACTED] consult with T. Cox regarding same	5.25
10/21/2021	T S COX	Prepare [REDACTED] at request of R. Bates	2.50
10/22/2021	R M BATES	Prepare for and attend oral argument for motion for preliminary injunction; telephone call with J. Foster regarding same; consult with S. Rewari regarding same; coordinate [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED] consult with J. Foster [REDACTED]	7.50
10/22/2021	T S COX	Matters re [REDACTED]	0.75



DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/22/2021	E C HENDERSON	Begin conducting legal research regarding [REDACTED]; begin drafting [REDACTED]	1.00
10/22/2021	S REWARI	Call with R. Bates regarding hearing; review order; emails regarding same	0.75
10/25/2021	R M BATES	Review correspondence from [REDACTED]; consult with S. Haynie regarding same; e-mail correspondence with E. Kennedy regarding same; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster regarding same	0.50
10/25/2021	E C HENDERSON	Continue conducting legal research regarding [REDACTED]; continue drafting [REDACTED]	2.50
10/26/2021	R M BATES	Review research [REDACTED]; consult with E. Henderson regarding same; consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy; consult with J. Foster regarding same; consult with firm colleagues regarding [REDACTED]; prepare strategy regarding same	2.25
10/26/2021	E C HENDERSON	Conduct legal research regarding [REDACTED]	2.50
10/26/2021	S REWARI	Emails with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]	0.25
10/27/2021	R M BATES	Consult with E. Henderson regarding [REDACTED]; review research regarding same; review and revise [REDACTED]; e-mail correspondence with S. Rewari regarding same	1.50
10/27/2021	E C HENDERSON	Continue conducting legal research; summarize research; Zoom conference with R. Bates	2.50
10/28/2021	R M BATES	Review correspondence related to [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]; consult with S. Rewari regarding same; consult with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding same; review [REDACTED]; consult with E. Henderson regarding additional research; e-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding brief sealing; e-mail correspondence with J. Foster and E. Kennedy regarding [REDACTED]	3.75
10/28/2021	E C HENDERSON	Respond to question regarding [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Mr. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]; conduct legal research regarding [REDACTED]; begin drafting summary of research	3.50
10/28/2021	S REWARI	Emails regarding [REDACTED]; emails regarding [REDACTED]; review research	0.50

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP  
CLIENT NAME: Fairfax County School Board  
FILE NUMBER: 037077.MULTI

INVOICE: 102210480  
DATE: 01/18/2022  
PAGE: 27

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
10/29/2021	R M BATES	Prepare [REDACTED]; review research related to same; review [REDACTED] consult with S. Rewari regarding case strategy	4.00
10/29/2021	E C HENDERSON	Finish conducting research; finish [REDACTED]	1.50
10/29/2021	S REWARI	Call with R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]; second call with R. Bates regarding same	0.50
10/30/2021	S E HAYNIE	Review correspondence and respond to R. Bates regarding [REDACTED]	0.25
10/31/2021	R M BATES	Review research in conjunction with [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]; consult with S. Rewari and S. Haynie regarding same	2.50
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>			<b>135.50</b>

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
R M BATES	Partner	63.00	750.00	47,250.00
S REWARI	Partner	9.00	750.00	6,750.00
T S COX	Counsel	19.75	595.00	11,751.25
R D FAIRBANKS	Counsel	2.50	595.00	1,487.50
S E HAYNIE	Senior Associate	21.75	495.00	10,766.25
E C HENDERSON	Staff Attorney	16.50	395.00	6,517.50
R G BOCZKAJ-GONZALEZ	Paralegal	3.00	205.00	615.00
<b>TOTAL FEES (\$)</b>				<b>85,137.50</b>

**FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:**

CODE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E107	Delivery/Messenger Services	644.58
E108	Postage	2.12
E118	Litigation Support Vendors	9,492.40
E124	Other - Miscellaneous	90.00
<b>TOTAL CURRENT EXPENSES (\$)</b>		<b>10,229.10</b>

**MATTER SUMMARY:**

Current Fees:	\$ 85,137.50
Current Charges:	10,229.10
<b>CURRENT MATTER AMOUNT DUE:</b>	<b>\$ 95,366.60</b>